
Event Number 19-207 Addendum 1 Organization Lincoln Purchasing
Event Title Motor Grader Snow Removal Services for LaWorkgroup Lincoln Purchasing
Event Description Event Owner Sharon Mulder
Event Type Bid Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
Issue Date 7/26/2019 02:30:01 PM (CT) Phone (402) 441-7428
Close Date 8/9/2019 12:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (402) 441-6513

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENLincoln NE 8/1/2019 10:34:43 AM (CT) 0 $0.00
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Lincoln NE 7/26/2019 03:12:18 PM (CT) 2 $330.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating Martell NE 8/9/2019 08:10:55 AM (CT) 2 $450.00
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (Martell NE 8/9/2019 10:07:55 AM (CT) 4 $1,100.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.

19-207 Addendum 1 - Page 1

B-19-0207



1
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified Enter 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour $165.00 $165.00

2
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified Enter 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour $165.00 $165.00

3
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified Enter 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid

4
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified Enter 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid

5
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour $225.00 $225.00
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified 
Enterprises Inc) 1 Hour $275.00 $275.00

6
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
County Motor Grader 2 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 1 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 2 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 1 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 2 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 1 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services
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MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified 
Enterprises Inc) 1 Hour $275.00 $275.00

7
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour $225.00 $225.00
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified 
Enterprises Inc) 1 Hour $275.00 $275.00

8
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. 1 Hour No Bid
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1 Hour No Bid
K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) 1 Hour No Bid
HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains Diversified 
Enterprises Inc) 1 Hour $275.00 $275.00

County Motor Grader 1 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

County Motor Grader 2 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes
MURPHY TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT CO.INC. Herb Wolkenhauer hwolkenhauer@murphytractor.com

K2 Construction (K2 Real Estate Development) Travis Sondgeroth travis@k2construction.biz
CAT 135H
John Deere 672G

Gana Trucking & Excavating Adam Root adamr@ganatrucking.com

HIGH PLAINS ENTERPRISES INC (High Plains 
Diversified Enterprises Inc) Micah Messick micah@highplainsnebraska.com

We are bidding 2 total motor graders for district 3 and 4.  
We can either separate the 2 machines and they run 
different districts or run the same district together.
Our motor graders are a John Deere 772CH and John 
Deere 770CH
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19-207 Addendum 1
Gana Trucking & Excavating

Supplier Response

Event Information
Number: 19-207 Addendum 1
Title: Motor Grader Snow Removal Services for Lancaster County
Type: Notice to Bidders
Issue Date: 7/26/2019
Deadline: 8/9/2019 12:00 PM (CT)

Contact Information
Contact: Sharon Mulder Asst Purchasing Agent
Address: Purchasing

440 S. 8th St.
Suite 200
Lincoln, NE 68508

Phone: (402) 441-7428
Fax: (402) 441-6513
Email: smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
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Gana Trucking & Excavating Information
Contact: Adam Root
Address: 2200 West Panama Road

Martell, NE 68404
Phone: (402) 794-5000
Fax: (402) 794-5002
Email: adamr@ganatrucking.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Adam Root adamr@ganatrucking.com
Signature Email
Submitted at 8/9/2019 8:10:55 AM

Bid Attributes

1 Instructions to Bidders
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions to Bidders.
Yes

2 Insurance Requirements
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Insurance Requirements.
Yes

3 Sample Contract
I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample contract.
Yes

4 Specifications
I acknowledge reading and understanding the specifications.
Yes

5 Bid Documents
I acknowledge and accept that it is my responsibility as a Bidder to promptly notify the Purchasing Department Staff 
prior to the close of the bid of any ambiguity, inconsistency or error which I may discover upon examination of the bi
d documents including, but not limited to the Specifications.
Yes

6 Contact
Name of person submitting this bid:
Adam Root

7 Renewal is an Option
Contract Extenstion Renewal is an option.
Yes
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8 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special Provision Term Contract Provisions.
Yes

9 Term Clause of Contract
I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1) year term with the option for two (2) additional one (1) ye
ar renewals from the date of the executed contract. 
(a) Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract period. YES or NO

(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation YES or NO

(c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm: through _____________________
A.) Yes B.) Yes C.) First 1 year contract

1
0

Employee Class Act EO
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Employee Classification Act, Executive Order 83319.
Yes

1
1

Employee Class Act Affidavit
I acknowledge if awarded the contract I will abide by the law, notarize and attach the Employee Classification Act Affi
davit to my contract.
Yes

1
2

Bid award
I acknowledge and understand that the City, County and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to award 
bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options, by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the requirem
ents and interests of the City, County and/or Public Building Commission.

If your pricing is based on an all-or-nothing basis, please indicate so in the Supplier Notes section of your E-Bid res
ponse.
Yes

1
3

Disaster Plan
DISASTER PLAN PARTICIPATION: If awarded a contract, can the City of Lincoln call on your firm to participate in a d
isaster relief/cleanup plan with your company performing duties similar to those in the contract? YES or NO If YES, I 
understand that the terms and pricing will not deviate from the executed contract.
YES

1
4

Electronic Signature
Please check here for your electronic signature.
Yes

1
5

Agreement to Addendum No. 1
Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal an
d is part of their bid. 
Reason: ATTACHED AN UPDATED LANCASTER COUNTY MAP.
Yes

Bid Lines
Page 3 of 4 pages Vendor: Gana Trucking & Excavating 19-207 Addendum 1



1 County Motor Grader 1 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 1

2 County Motor Grader 2 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 1

3 County Motor Grader 1 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 2

4 County Motor Grader 2 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 2

5 County Motor Grader 1 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour Unit Price: $225.00 Total: $225.00
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 3

6 County Motor Grader 2 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 3

7 County Motor Grader 1 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour Unit Price: $225.00 Total: $225.00
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 4

8 County Motor Grader 2 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 4

Response Total: $450.00
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19-207 Addendum 1
K2 Construction

Supplier Response

Event Information
Number: 19-207 Addendum 1
Title: Motor Grader Snow Removal Services for Lancaster County
Type: Notice to Bidders
Issue Date: 7/26/2019
Deadline: 8/9/2019 12:00 PM (CT)

Contact Information
Contact: Sharon Mulder Asst Purchasing Agent
Address: Purchasing

440 S. 8th St.
Suite 200
Lincoln, NE 68508

Phone: (402) 441-7428
Fax: (402) 441-6513
Email: smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
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K2 Construction Information
Contact: Tom Rogge
Address: 7701 Cornhusker Highway

Lincoln, NE 68507
Phone: (402) 467-2355
Fax: (402) 467-2055
Email: trogge@k2construction.biz

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Travis Sondgeroth travis@k2construction.biz
Signature Email
Submitted at 7/26/2019 3:12:18 PM

Supplier Note
CAT 135H John Deere 672G

Bid Attributes

1 Instructions to Bidders
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions to Bidders.
Yes

2 Insurance Requirements
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Insurance Requirements.
Yes

3 Sample Contract
I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample contract.
Yes

4 Specifications
I acknowledge reading and understanding the specifications.
Yes

5 Bid Documents
I acknowledge and accept that it is my responsibility as a Bidder to promptly notify the Purchasing Department Staff 
prior to the close of the bid of any ambiguity, inconsistency or error which I may discover upon examination of the bi
d documents including, but not limited to the Specifications.
Yes

6 Contact
Name of person submitting this bid:
Travis Sondgeroth
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7 Renewal is an Option
Contract Extenstion Renewal is an option.
Yes

8 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special Provision Term Contract Provisions.
Yes

9 Term Clause of Contract
I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1) year term with the option for two (2) additional one (1) ye
ar renewals from the date of the executed contract. 
(a) Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract period. YES or NO

(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation YES or NO

(c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm: through _____________________
Yes, Yes

1
0

Employee Class Act EO
I acknowledge reading and understanding the Employee Classification Act, Executive Order 83319.
Yes

1
1

Employee Class Act Affidavit
I acknowledge if awarded the contract I will abide by the law, notarize and attach the Employee Classification Act Affi
davit to my contract.
Yes

1
2

Bid award
I acknowledge and understand that the City, County and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to award 
bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options, by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the requirem
ents and interests of the City, County and/or Public Building Commission.

If your pricing is based on an all-or-nothing basis, please indicate so in the Supplier Notes section of your E-Bid res
ponse.
Yes

1
3

Disaster Plan
DISASTER PLAN PARTICIPATION: If awarded a contract, can the City of Lincoln call on your firm to participate in a d
isaster relief/cleanup plan with your company performing duties similar to those in the contract? YES or NO If YES, I 
understand that the terms and pricing will not deviate from the executed contract.
Yes

1
4

Electronic Signature
Please check here for your electronic signature.
Yes

Page 3 of 4 pages Vendor: K2 Construction 19-207 Addendum 1



1
5

Agreement to Addendum No. 1
Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal an
d is part of their bid. 
Reason: ATTACHED AN UPDATED LANCASTER COUNTY MAP.
No response

Bid Lines

1 County Motor Grader 1 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour Unit Price: $165.00 Total: $165.00
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 1

2 County Motor Grader 2 - District 1; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour Unit Price: $165.00 Total: $165.00
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 1

3 County Motor Grader 1 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 2

4 County Motor Grader 2 - District 2; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 2

5 County Motor Grader 1 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 3

6 County Motor Grader 2 - District 3; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 3

7 County Motor Grader 1 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 4

8 County Motor Grader 2 - District 4; Cost per Hour for actual Snow Plowing Services

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hour No Bid
Item Notes:

Per attached map, area marked District 4

Response Total: $330.00

Page 4 of 4 pages Vendor: K2 Construction 19-207 Addendum 1



1

Sharon R. Mulder

From: Leroy T. Geistlinger
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 1:46 PM
To: Sharon R. Mulder
Cc: Ron L. Bohaty
Subject: RE: 19-207

Sharon, looking at the previous contracts, $45,000 was the total for all the contracts.  We should be able to stay with the 
same amount between both contracts, thanks. 
 
From: Sharon R. Mulder <SMulder@lincoln.ne.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 11:18 AM 
To: Leroy T. Geistlinger <LGeistlinger@lancaster.ne.gov> 
Cc: Ron L. Bohaty <RBohaty@lancaster.ne.gov> 
Subject: RE: 19-207 
Importance: High 
 
Bud, 
I need an overall dollar figure that the County would spend for the upcoming year for this contract in order to put it on 
the County Board’s Agenda for next week. 
Thank you, 
Sharon 
 
From: Leroy T. Geistlinger <LGeistlinger@lancaster.ne.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2019 10:49 AM 
To: Rachelle J. Hinze <rhinze@lincoln.ne.gov> 
Cc: Ron L. Bohaty <RBohaty@lancaster.ne.gov>; Sharon R. Mulder <SMulder@lincoln.ne.gov> 
Subject: 19-207 
 

AWARD RECOMMENDATION (Multiple Vendors) 
[Lancaster County] has reviewed the bid responses for [19-207.] and made the following determination: 
Award Line Items [1,2] to [K-2] for a total of [$165/hr], as they are the lowest responsible, responsive Bidder meeting all 
requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.     
 
Award Line Items [5,7] to [Gana] for a total of [$225/hr], as they are the lowest responsible, responsive Bidder meeting all 
requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.     
 
Award Line Items [XX] to [Company Name] for a total of [$], as they are the lowest responsible, responsive Bidder 
meeting all requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.     
    
Total Award Amount for All Vendors: [$390/hr] 
[Lines 1&2 K2 construction is the only bidder. Lines 5&7 Gana is the lowest responsible bidder.  Lines 6&8 arenot 
awarded due to High Plains Enterprises being banned from County bidding for a 2 year period] 

OR 
AWARD RECOMMENDATION (No Award) 

[Department] has reviewed the bid responses for [Bid/Quote No.] and made the determination that this will be a “No 
Award” due to the following reason[s]:   
 
[Provide a detailed explanation as to why your Department will be recommending a “No Award” and select Option 1 or 2 
below – remove the option that is not applicable] 
(*Important:  A No Award for the City will require acceptance by the Purchasing Agent and the Mayor) 
[Option 1] Our Department does not desire to rebid.  



2

[Option 2] Our Department desires to rebid and will work with Purchasing to initiate the process (Note:  A rebid necessitates 
a change to the Specifications, related documents or intent and a rebid cannot be started until the Purchasing Agent and Mayor accepts 
the “No Award” – this approval process applies to City only.).  
 
 
LeRoy (Bud) Geistlinger 
Asst. Road Maintenance Superintendent 
Office 402-441-6030 
Cell 402-560-2096 
lgeistlinger@lancaster.ne.gov 
 




