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AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
Silver Ridge Construction 

This Amendment is hereby entered into by and between Silver Ridge Construction, 3830 S. 6th ST., Ste. 
5, Lincoln, NE  68502 (hereinafter “Contractor”) and the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and the City of Lincoln-
Lancaster County Public Building Commission (hereinafter “Owners”), for the purpose of amending the Contract 
dated March 2, 2017 executed under City Resolution No. 90268, and County Contract C-17-0079, dated February 
14, 2017, and executed by the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission, on February 14, 
2017, for Unit Price – Pavement/Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285, which is made a part of this amendment by 
this reference.  

WHEREAS, the original term of the Contract is March 1, 2017 through February 28, 2019, with 
the option to renew for two (2) additional two (2) year terms upon written mutual consent by all parties; and 

WHEREAS, the parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1, 
2019 through February 28, 2021; and  

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect price changes and additional line items as 
listed on Quotation Sheet (per Attachment 1). 

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$230,000.00 for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$50,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the 
term of this renewal shall not exceed $20,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public Building 
Commission; and  

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the 
following language:  

OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that “Owner/s” shall include the 
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building 
Commission.  Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the County” or “Building 
Commission”) in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders, specifications, insurance 
requirements, bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents which are a part of the 
Contract, it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and 
the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, the 
duties and obligations of the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County 
Public Building Commission pursuant to the Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable 
duties and obligations, and default by any one of the Owners shall not be attributed to any other 
of the Owners, but shall remain the sole obligation of the defaulting entity. 
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NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants contained in the Contract under City 
Resolution 90268 and County Contract C-17-0079, all amendments thereto, and as stated herein, the parties 
agree as follows: 

1) The parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1,
2019 through February 28, 2021.

2) The parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect price changes and additional line items as listed
on Quotation Sheet (per Attachment 1).

3) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $230,000.00
for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln.

4) The expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $50,000.00
for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board.

5) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the
term of this renewal shall not exceed $20,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public
Building Commission.

6) The parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the
following language:  OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that
“Owner/s” shall include the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County
Public Building Commission.  Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the
County” or “Building Commission”) in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders,
specifications, insurance requirements, bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents
which are a part of the Contract, it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln,
Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building
Commission.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, the duties and obligations of the City of Lincoln,
Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission pursuant to the
Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable duties and obligations, and default by any
one of the Owners shall not be attributed to any other of the Owners, but shall remain the sole
obligation of the defaulting entity.

7) All other terms of the Contract, not in conflict with this Amendment, shall remain in force and
effect.

The Parties do hereby agree to all the terms and conditions of this Amendment.  This Amendment shall 
be binding upon the parties, their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal representatives, 
successors, and assigns. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties do hereby execute this Amendment upon completion of 
signatures on: 

Vendor Signature Page 
City of Lincoln Signature Page 
Lancaster County Signature Page 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission Signature Page     
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City of Lincoln Signature Page 

___________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
Silver Ridge Construction 

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

ATTEST: 

___________________________________ 
City Clerk  

CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

__________________________________________ 
Chris Beutler, Mayor 

Approved by Executive Order No._______________ 

dated _____________________________________ 



Tracking No. 19010182 

      Lancaster County Signature Page 

____________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
Silver Ridge Construction 

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA 

The Board of County Commissioners of 
Lancaster, Nebraska 

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

dated _________________________________ 

Contract Approved as to Form: 

______________________________________ 
Deputy Lancaster County Attorney 

C-19-0141
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City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Signature Page 
 
 

___________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
Silver Ridge Construction 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

EXECUTION BY LINCOLN-LANCASTER COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION 
 
 
 

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
______________________________________     ____________________________________ 
Public Building Commission Attorney   Chairperson, Public Building Commission 
 
 
       dated _______________________________ 

 
 
 

 
        



Attachment 1

Date:                                 
TO DEPARTMENT/AGENCY REPRESENTATIVE:                                                                         
FROM (CONTRACTOR):        Silver Ridge Construction               AWARD LEVEL:  3
PROJECT DESCRIPTION:                                                                                                              

TIME OF COMPLETION

EQUIPMENT AND MATERIAL COSTS
ITEM COST Estimated Total

Total Rental Equipment Costs
Total Materials Cost
Total Shipping/Freight Cost

MOBILIZATION
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

 Mobilization - Equipment and Labor $175.00 LS

SCHEDULE I - CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

1.  Type "A" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $5.50 LF
2.  Type "B" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $5.50 LF
3.  Type "C" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $5.50 LF
4.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal $50.00 CY
5.  Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $4.25 SF
6.  Concrete Sidewalk, 7" Thick $7.45 SF
7.  Concrete Sidewalk, 9" Thick $9.50 SF
8.  Concrete Sidewalk, 10" Thick $10.00 SF
9.  Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $4.50 SF
10.  Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $5.00 SF
11.  Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $5.50 SF
12.  Detectable Warning Panel $16.00 SF
13.  Remove Concrete Sidwalk, 4" Thick $2.00 SF
14.  Remove Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $2.00 SF
15.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $2.50 SF
16.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $2.75 SF
17.  Sub-Grade Preparation $0.50 SY
18.  5" Concrete Base (L-5500) $49.50 SY
19.  8" Concrete Base (L-5500) $58.50 SY
20.  Tie Bars $3.00 EA
21.  Surface Milling No Bid SY
22.  24" Curb and Gutter $25.00 LF
23.  Adjust Manhold to Grade $500.00 LS
24.  Adjust Water Valve Box to Grade $500.00 LS
25.  Remove & Reset Storm Inlet Top $750.00 LS
26.  Install & Remove Curb Inlet Filters $500.00 LS
27.  Parking Space Finish (Minor grading and preparing the 
area between the sidewalk and curb for either seed / sod $15.00 SY

CITY OF LINCOLN, LANCASTER COUNTY, CITY OF LINCOLN-LANCASTER                        
COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION                                                    

UNIT PRICE QUOTATION

Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285

Fill in the following Tables in the areas as shown.      If an item does not apply, please do not make an entry in that column. 
                                                                                                                                                                 

Estimated Start Date

% of Markup
12%
12%

This Document Is Required For All Unit Price Projects

Number of Days to Complete

1 Revised 1/10/2019
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28.  Modular Block Retaining Wall (Based on total area of 
the retaining wall installed) No Bid SF
29.  Seeding $0.25 SF
30.  Sodding $2.00 SF
Total

SCHEDULE II -  ASPHALTIC CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quanitity Estimated Total

1.  Type "A" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement $5.50 LF
2.  Type "D" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement $6.50 LF
3.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal $45.00 CY
4.  Install Asphaltic Concrete Curb No Bid LF
5.  Remove Asphaltic Concrete Curb $4.50 LF
6.  Install Concrete Curb $21.00 LF
7.  Remove Concrete Curb $5.50 LF
8. Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Class 2, Non-Arterial 
Streets & Parking Area No Bid SY
10.  Asphaltic Concrete Resurfacing No Bid TON
11.  Paint Pavement Marking with Glass Beads No Bid LF
12.  Paint Pavement Marking, without Glass Beads No Bid LF
13. Street Patching, 6" Thick No Bid SF
14. Street Patching, 8" Thick No Bid SF
15.  Alternate Sidewalk Repairs No Bid Inch-Foot
Total

SUBCONTRACTORS COSTS
SUB-CONTRACTOR (NAME) COST % of Markup Estimated Total

Sub No. 1 12%
Sub No. 2 12%

FIRM:                                                                                APPROVED BY:___________________
BY:                                                                                      Department Agency/Rep

ADDRESS:                                                                        PHONE NO:______________________

                                                                                          DATE:___________________________

 $ TOTAL ESTIMATED COST -- NOT TO EXCEED:

Change Order #: __________________
Accepted:_______________________
Not Accepted :___________________

2 Revised 1/10/2019



CONSTRUCTION PERFORMANCE BOND Bond Number RCN2146710

Any singular reference to Contractor, Surety, Owner or other party shall be considered plural where applicable.

CONTRACTOR (Name and Address):

Silver Ridge Construction

P.O. Box 22812

Lincoln, NE 68542

Owner (Name and Address):

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and

Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission

555 South 10th St.
Lincoln, NE 68508

SURET/ (Name and Principal

Place of Business):

Old Republic Surety Company
1415 28th St, Suite 420

West Des Moines, IA 50266

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
Date:

Amount: $50,000.00

Description (Name and Location):

For all labor, material and equipment necessary for Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete

Services, Bid No. 16-285; March 1, 2019 through February 28, 2021

BOND
Date: March 1,2019

Amount: $50,000.00

Modifications to this Bond Form: None

CONTRACTOR AS PRINCIPAL
Company:

Silver Ridge Construction

P.O. Box 5461

Lincoln, NE 68505

Signature: J^
Name a^Tftl

_^r3%^

(Corp. Seal)
SURETY
Company: (Corp.Seal)

Old Republic Surety Company

Pi^Si

Jl^A^MA-
Name and Title: Andrew P Andersen, Attorney-in-fact

Signature:.

EJCDC NO. 1910-28a (1984 Edition)
Prepared through the joint efforts of The Surety Assoc. of America. Engineers' Joint Contract Documents Committee. The

Associated General Contractors of America, and the American Institute of Architects.

Silver UP 16-285 dw
PAGE NO. 12



The Contractor and the Surety, jointly and severally, bind themselves their heirs,

executors, administrators, successors and assigns to the Owner for the

performance of the Construction Contract, which Is Incorporated herein by

reference.

If the Contractor performs ths Construction Contract, the Surety and the Contractor

shall have no obligation under this Bond, except to participate in conferences as

provided in Subparagraph 3.1.
If there Is no Owner Default, the Surety's obligation under this Bond shall arise

after:

3.1 The Owner has notified the Contractor and the Surety at its address

described In Paragraph 10 below, that the Owner Is considering declaring a

Contractor Default and has requested and attempted to arrange a conference with

the Contractor and the Surety to be held not later than fifteen days after receipt of

such notice to discuss methods of performing the Construction Contract. If the

Owner, the Contractor and the Surety agree, the Contractor shall be allowed a

reasonable time to perform the Construction Contract, but such an agreement shall

not waive the Owner's right, if any, subsequently to declare a Contractor Default

and

3.2 The Owner has declared a Contractor Default and formally terminated the

Contractor's right to complete the contract. Such Contractor Default shall not be

declared earlier than twenty days after the Contractor and the Surety have received

notice as provided in Sub-paragraph 3.1; and

3.3 The Owner has agreed to pay the Balance of the Contract Price to the

Surety In accordance with the terms of the Construction Contract or to a contractor

selected to perform the Construction Contract in accordance with the terms of the

contract with the Owner.

When the Owner has satisfied the conditions of Paragraph 3, the Surety shall

promptly and at the Surety's expense take one of the following actions:

4.1 Arrange for the Contractor, with consent of the Owner, to perform and

complete the Construction Contract, or

4.2 Undertake to perform and complete the Construction Contract itself,

through Its agents or through independent contractors: or

4.3 Obtain bids or negotiated proposals from qualified contractors

acceptable to the Owner for a contract for performance and completion of the

Construction Contract, arrange for a contract to be prepared for execution by the

Owner and the contractor selected with the Owner's concurrence, to be secured

with performance and payment bonds executed by a qualified surety equivalent to

the bonds Issued on the Construction Contract, and pay to the Owner the amount

of damages as described in Paragraph 6 in excess of the Balance of the Contract

Price Incurred by the Owner resulting from the Contractor's default, or

4.4 Waive its right to perform and complete, arrange for completion, or obtain a

new contractor and with reasonable promptness under the circumstances:

1. After Investigation, determine the amount for which it may be liable to the

Owner and as soon as practiceable after the amount is determined tender payment

therefor to the Owner; or

2. Deny liability in whole or in part and notify the Owner citing reasons

therefor.

If the Surety does not proceed as provided in Paragraph 4 with reasonable

promptness, the Surety shall be deemed to be in default on this Bond fifteen days

after receipt of an additional written notice from the Owner to the Surety demanding

that the Surety perform its obligations under this Bond, and the Owner shall be

entitled to enforce any remedy available to the Owner. If the Surety proceeds as

provided in Subparagraph 4.4 and the Owner refuses payment tendered or the

Surety has denied liability, In whole or In part, without further notice the Owner shall

be entitled to enforce any remedy available to the Owner.

10.

11.

12.

After the Owner has terminated the Contractor's right to complete the

Construction Contract, and if the Surety elects to act under Subparagraph 4.1,

4.2, or 4.3 above, then the responsibilities of the Surety to the Owner shall not be

greater than those of the Contractor under the Construction Contract, and the

responsibilities of the Owner to the Surety shall not be greater than those of the

Owner under the Construction Contract. To the limit of the amount of this Bond,

but subject to commitment by the Owner of the Balance of the Contract Price to

mitigation of costs and damages on the Construction Contract, the Surety is

obligated without duplication for:

6.1 The responsibilities of the Contractor for correction of defective work and

completion of the Construction Contract;

6.2 Additional legal, design professional and delay costs resulting from the

Contractor's Default, and resulting from the actions or failure to act of the Surety

under Paragraph 4; an d

6.3 Liquidated damages, or if no liquidated damages are specified in the

Construction Contract, actual damages caused by delayed performance or non-

performance of the Contractor.

The Surety shall not be liable to the Owner or others for obligations of the

Contractor that are unrelated to the Construction Contract, and the Balance of the

Contract Price shall not be reduced or set off on account of any such unrelated

obligations. No right of action shall accrue on this Bond to any person or entity

other than the Owner or its heirs, executors, administrators, or successors.

The Surety hereby waives notice of any change, including changes of time, to the

Construction Contract or to related sub-contracts, purchase orders and other

obligations.

Any proceeding, legal or equitable, under this Bond may be instituted In any court

of competent Jurisdiction in the location in which the work or part of the work is

located and shall be instituted within two years after Contractor Default or within

two years after the Contractor ceased working or within two years after the Surety

refuses or fails to perform its obligations under this Bond, whichever occurs first.

If the provisions of this Paragraph are void or prohibited by law, the minimum

period of limitation available to sureties as a defense in the jurisdiction of the suit

shall be applicable.

Notice to the Surety, the Owner or the Contractor shall be mailed or delivered to

the address shown on the signature page.

When this Bond has been furnished to comply with a salutary or other legal

requirement in the location where the construction was to be performed, any

provision in this Bond conflicting with said statutory or legal requirement shall be

deemed deleted herefrom and provisions conforming to such statutory or other

legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated herein. The intent is that this

Bond shall be construed as a statutory bond and not as a common law bond.

Definitions.

12.1 Balance of the Contract Price: The total amount payable by the Owner to

the Contractor under the Construction Contract after all proper adjustments have

been made, Including allowance to the Contractor of any amounts received or to

be received by the Owner In settlement of insurance or other claims for damages

to which the Contractor is entitled, reduced by all valid and proper payments

made to or on behalf of the Contractor under the Construction Contract.

12.2 Construction Contract: The agreement between the Owner and the

Contractor identified on the signature page, including all Contract Documents and

changes thereto.

12.3 Contractor Default: Failure of the Contractor, which has neither been

remedied nor waived, to perform or otherwise to comply with the terms of the

Construction Contract.

12.4 Owner Default: Failure of the Owner, which has neither been remedied

nor waived, to pay the Contractor as required by the Construction Contract or to

perform and complete or comply with the other terms thereof.

Silver UP 16-285 dw
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Bond Number RCN2146710

CONSTRUCTION PAYMENT BOND

Any singular reference to Contractor, Surety, Owner or other party shall be considered plural where applicable.

CONTRACTOR (Name and Address):

Silver Ridge Construction

P.O. Box 22812

Lincoln, NE 68542

SURETY (Name and Principal Place

Of Business):

Old Republic Surety Company
1415 28th St, Suite 420 West
Des Moines, IA 50266

Owner (Name and Address):

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and

Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission

555 South 10th St.
Lincoln, NE 68508

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
Date:

Amount: $50,000.00

Description (Name and Location):

For all labor, material and equipment necessary for Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete

Services, Bid No. 16-285; March 1, 2019 through February 28, 2021

BOND
Date: March 1,2019

Amount: $50,000.00

Modifications to this Bond Form: None

CONTRACTOR AS PRINCIPAL
Company: (Corp. Seal)

Silver Ridge Construction

P.O. Box 5461

Lincoln, NE 68505

Signatu'

Name

SURETY
Company: (Corp. Seal)

Old Republic Surety Company ^W[»Hlt,,^

;«„„«.

^U^)AL^Signature:
Name and Title: Andrew P Andersen, Attorney-in-fact

EJCDC NO. 1910-28B (1984 Edllion)
Prepared through the joint efforts of The Surety Assoc. of America. Engineers' Joint Contract Documents Committee. The
Associated General Contractors of America, and the American Institute of Architects.

SUyer UP 16-285 dw
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1. The Contractor and the Surety, jointly and severally, bind themselves their
heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns to the Owner to

pay for labor, materials and equipment furnished for use in the
performance of the Construction Contract, which Is incorporated herein by
reference.

2. With respect to the Owner, this obligation shall be null and void if the
Contractor:

2.1 Promptly makes payment, directly or indirectly, for all sums due
Claimants, and

2.2 Defends, indemnifies and holds harmless the Owner from all

claims, demands, liens or suits by any person or entity who furnished
labor, materials or equipment for use in the performance of the
Construction Contract, provided the Owner has promptly notified the
Contractor and the Surety (at the address described in Paragraph 12) of
any claims, demands, liens or suits and tendered defense of such claims,

demands, liens or suits to the Contractor and the Surety, and provided
there is no Owner Default.

3. With respect to Claimants, this obligation shall be null and void if the

Contractor promptly makes payment, directly or indirectly, for all sums due.
4. The Surety shall have no obligation to Claimants under this Bond until:

4.1 Claimants who do not have a direct contract with the Contractor
have given notice to the Surety (at the address described in Paragraph

12) and sent a copy, or notice thereof to the Owner, stating that a claim is
being made under this Bond and with substantial accuracy the amount of
the claim.

4.2 Claimants who do not have a direct contract with the Contractor:
1 .Have furnished written notice to the Contractor and sent a copy,

or notice thereof, to the Owner, within 90 days after having last performed
labor or last furnished materials or equipment included in the claim stating,
with substantial accuracy, the amount of the claim and the name of the
party to whom the materials were furnished or supplied or for whom the
labor was done or performed, and

2.Have either received a rejection in whole or in part from the
Contractor, or not received within 30 days of furnishing the above notice
any communication from the Contractor by which the Contractor has
indicated the claim will be paid directly or indirectly; and

3.Not having been paid within the above 30 days, have sent a
written notice to the Surety (at the address described in Paragraph 12) and
sent a copy, or notice thereof, to the Owner, stating that a claim is being
made under this Bond and enclosing a copy of the previous written notice
furnished to the Contractor.

5. If a notice required by Paragraph 4 is given by the Owner to the Contractor
or to the Surety, that is sufficient compliance.

6. When the Claimant has satisfied the conditions of Paragraph 4, the Surety
shall promptly and at the Surety's expense take the following actions:

6.1 Send an answer to the Claimant, with a copy to the Owner, within
45 days after receipt of the claim, stating the amounts that are undisputed
and the basis for challenging any amounts that are disputed.

6.2 Pay or arrange for payment of any undisputed amounts.
7. The Surety's total obligation shall not exceed the amount of this Bond, and

the amount of this Bond shall be credited for any payments made in good

faith by the Surety.
8. Amounts owed by the Owner to the Contractor under the Construction

Contract shall be used for the performance of the Construction Contract
and to satisfy claims, if any, under any Construction Performance Bond.

By the Contractor furnishing and the Owner accepting this Bond, they
agree that all funds earned by the Contractor in the performance of the
Construction Contract are dedicated to satisfy obligations of the
Contractor and the Surety under this Bond, subject to the Owner's

priority to the funds for the completion of the work.
9. The Surety shall not be liable to the Owner, Claimants or others for

obligations of the Contractor that are unrelated to the Construction
Contract. The Owner shall not be liable for payment of any costs or
expenses of any Claimant under this Bond, and shall have under this

Bond no obligations to make payments to, give notices on behalf of, or
otherwise have obligations to Claimants under this Bond.

10. The Surety hereby waives notice of any change, including changes of
time, to the Construction Contract or to related subcontracts, purchase

orders and other obligations.
11. No suite or action shall be commenced by a Claimant under this Bond

other than in a court of competent Jurisdiction in the location in which

the work or part of the work is located or after the expiration of one
year from the date (1 ) on which the Claimant gave the notice required
by Subparagraph 4.1 or Clause 4.1 (ill), or (2) on which the last labor or
service was performed by anyone or the last materials or equipment
were furnished by anyone under the Construction Contract, whichever

of (1) or (2) first occurs. If the provisions of this Paragraph are void or
prohibited by law, the minimum period of limitation available to sureties
as a defense in the jurisdiction of the suit shall be applicable.

12. Notice to the Surety, the Owner or the Contractor shall be mailed or
delivered to the address shown on the signature page. Actual receipt
of notice by Surety, the Owner or the Contractor, however

accomplished, shall be sufficient compliance as of the date received at
the address shown on the signature page.

13. When this Bond has been furnished to comply with a statutory or other
legal requirement in the location where the construction was to be
performed, any provision in this Bond conflicting with said statutory or
legal requirement shall be deemed deleted here from and provisions
conforming to such statutory or other legal requirement shall be
deemed incorporated herein. The intent is, that this Bond shall be
construed as a statutory bond and not as a common law bond.

14. Upon request by any person or entity appearing to be a potential
beneficiary of this Bond, the Contractor shall promptly furnish a copy of

this Bond or shall permit a copy to be made.
15. DEFINITIONS

15.1 Claimant: An individual or entity having a direct contract with
the Contractor or with a subcontractor of the Contractor to furnish

labor, materials or equipment for use in the performance of the
Contract. The intent of this Bond shall be to include without limitation

in the terms "labor, materials, or equipment" that part of water, gas,

power, light, heat, oil, gasoline, telephone service or rental equipment

used In the Construction Contract, architectural and engineering
services required for performance of the work of the Contractor and the
Contractor's subcontractors, and all other items for which a mechanic's

lien may be asserted In the jurisdiction where the labor, materials or
equipment were furnished.

15.2 Construction Contract: The agreement between the Owner
and the Contractor identified on the signature page, including all
Contract Documents and changes thereto.

15.3 Owner Default: Failure of the Owner, which has neither been
remedied nor waived, to pay the Contractor as required by the
Construction Contract or to perform and complete or comply with the
other terms thereof.

(FOR INFORMATION ONLY - NAME, ADDRESS AND TELEPHONE)
AGENT OR BROKER: OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE (ARCHITECT, ENGINEER OR OTHER PARTlQ
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KNOW ALUMEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That OLD REPUBLIC SURETY COMPANY, a Wisconsin stock insurance corporation, does make; constitute and
appoint: 11:/; 11"":".- :- •^.^.- ^. -.i-111 -111 —/:1::-::1 ..:; ~.;,y:;i,. :,;; ,.-;

,: KATE:R. GREENWALD, SCOTT.L WAGNER, GARY E. LEE, ANDREW P ANDERSEN, OF UNCOLN, NE „,, :::;<:;„,:„ ,;„ :,:

lts;true and lawful. Attprhey(s)-in-Fact, with full power;and authority,jnot;exceeding $50,000,000, forand:onbehal^ofthe;coigpany as surety,;to;executeand:deliver.
and affix the seal of the company thereto (if a seal is required), bonds, undertakings, recognizancesor other written obligations in the nature thereof, (other than bail
bonds, bank depository bonds, mortgage deficiency bonds, inqrtgage.guaranty bonds, guarantee.si of installment paper and note guaranty bonds, self-msurance workers
:compensa{|on:6onds guaranteeing payment of Beriefits, asbestoi^a6ateinent:cbntiia6t botKls, waste;management 6onas, Hazardous wpterefflediatjott'bonds or black lung
txinds), as'fullows:1 ;::|:: ;;'1 "!, IS :[:: s1 :;:1 j::: ;::, 1;; 1:/:, ::1^ :Y ^'^ 1 \, 1:; t, ,:: :;: 11'111:1':; ll:i; 11:;,: l";f ^ ;;/ 411"1'"!;: ll:li, :y: ^ 1:':1 'i1'111^

:SALL WRITTEN INSTRUMENTS IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED ::[ :;",:: :: i;::: ;:: <:

ONE MILLION DOLLARS($1,000,000)——— —————— FOR ANY SINGLE OBLIGATION.

;and to binclQLKREPQBHC SURETy:'eQMPANY thereby,:and all of the acts ofsaidAttomeys-ih-I7act,;pursuant:to th^e presents, are ratified and confirmed,:;
this'docuroent is not:valld unless printedqn colored background and is iTiultt-colored. This agpointmentiis made under and::by:authorit'/ ofthe^bpard ofdireefors
iat:a:speciallmeetingtreld on February 18,:1982. thts;Power of Attomeyis signed and sealed tiy facsimile: uhder:and tiyttie authority of the ftillowing resolutions
adopted by the board of directors of the OLD REPUBLIC SURETY COMPANY on February 18, 1982.

S RESOUVED dial, tUe president, any vice-president, or assistant vice:president, in conjunction with the secretary or atiypiissistant secretary, may apROiilti

attomeys-iri-factor agents with authority as defined or limjted:;in::the instrument evidencjhg the appouitihent in eactf case, for and on tiehalfofthe company to
,;::execute:!and deliver and affix the seal of the company to: bonds, undertakings, recogmzances, and suretyshipflbli^^ kinds; arid said officers may remove

any such attomey-in-tact or agent and revoke any Power of Attorney previously granted to such person.

RESOLVED PURTHER;::that:any bond,,undertaking, rec6gnizance, pr suretyshiRobligation sliall be valicland binaiiig upon'the^ConJpanyif :„,:.:
(i) whe%-signed|byttie;president, any vice president or assistant vice president, ancTattesfecl and sealed (if a seal be retiuireil):byians( secretary orassistant

secretary; on; .%i:^:/^ ?; :;: ,: ::;;;',:- ;:11 ::: l;\r 1;\ 1'1::1:,.;~::1: .:1;1: ::1 I: i:: :1~,:"::1: ;lf \ 111::'?:;1 ;::::, 1;:~;,,.?:S;1 ,? 's ^1 ^

(ii) wheti.signed by ttie: president, any;vice president or assistant vice:presideht, seci'etaryQt' assistant secretary, and countersigned and:sealed(tf<>:seal be
required) by a duly authorized attomey-in-fact or agent; or

, (iii) when duly executed and sealed (if a seal be required) by one or more attomeys-in-factor agents pursuant to and within the limits;ofthft authority

wideneed:by the Power of Attoi^yissued:by the company to swh person of peisons.^l ^';1^;::,::^1111:1::,::. :i ;': :i ;::;: ::: i. ::: ;; ;i : '•i::: ; ::::

RESOLVED FURTHER, that tKe signature of any authorized officer arid the seal o£tUe;:compariy:may be affixed::by;ifiCsumile to any Rpwer of Attorney or
"certification thereof authorizing theexecuti6nanddelivefyofany:bond, undertaking, !'ecognizatice,.oiother:suretyship obligations of the company; and such
signature and seal when so used shall have the same force and effect as though manually affixed.

IN WITNESS:WHEREQF;|PI.<D:REPIJBLIC SURETY COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed;by;its proper ofHcer;:and' its cotporafe seal to be
affixed this::;: :: ?:21 ST ^,,,ii/,i:dayof B XAUGUST,2017.1::::, : :/ :;:,::^,^ ;, ; :i, ;:i ;::,:^::: ,; 11:1:.<:111 -l, ":„,„ ^ j; . ;::; ^ ;:,-:,:::

OLD REPUBLIC SURETY COMPANY
^ '"'^
/^:7't,»»i»"T(^'yl!'l:lj

fsEAW
STATE OF WISCONSIN, COUNTY OF WAUK.ESHA-SS

i^%pi&^W^ ;idavdf::!::AUGUST,;20117

4,,,,^

:| :||: Jane BChemey
i, personally came before me,,;;"":;;:

President

;;Alan'Pavlic 1 and :-

I, to mejkriown to be the individuals anctofficei-s of the OILDJREPUBUIG SURETY COMPANYswhaexecuted th&atiove.

instrunwnf, and ttley:. each acknowleaged the ejtecuttori of the':saffie, and being by me dul^swom; di(i:seyerallydep6se;and:say; that they are;the said.Qfficereofthe
corporation aforesaid, and that the seal affixed to the above instrument is the seal of the corporation, and that said corporate seal and their signatures as such officers

were dulyiafRxed andsubscribed;tothe::said;instniment by the authority;oftheboard::ofdirectors:ofsaid coiporation.ss

Ml
; Notary Public:; :::::•:-

My commission expires: 9/28/201 8

;CE1H'IFI<3ATE: :;::i' ;:, ;i:'::i:; £ ^ 1?;1;:1:?1:'1:::':1::;1', 1^ iii ^ ;:;1::;'-"1':;; li. lt;:j?; ^(Expirgtton of notary commission does nAtlnvalldato^^

1, the undersigned, assistant secretary of the OLD RBPUBLIC SURETY COMPANY, a Wisconsin corporation, GERTH?Y|that the Ibregoing and attached Power

QfAttbmey;remainsinfull force and lias;not been revoked; andifurfhermore, that the Resolutions ofthe^board of directors; set forth in the Power of Attorney,: are now:ln

force.

40-0594 ;y^'*i»J^^;|^^^^;^^^^^^^ Signed::ancl sealed at;the City of Brookfieid.WI this

:|y^^|'B*|nJl,<^ | ;1:': | i:'' :.::;: I t,,::::l -' ^: ^
:::!;||t:,SEAy:iJ|:':l:i::l^,:l::il 11;:::::^:?:; l::l::.::;::::;::,Jf,'ili::l ::',| i?:^
V ^/^tK::iii' "' iwvi ' l:l;i:::::l;:::;111'1 -

^pf.
IINSPRO, INC;

2285 •fiWC







INSR ADDL SUBR
LTR INSR WVD

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

PRODUCER CONTACT
NAME:

FAXPHONE
(A/C, No):(A/C, No, Ext):

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

INSURER A :

INSURED INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

POLICY NUMBER
POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

TYPE OF INSURANCE LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY)

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

Y / N

N / A
(Mandatory in NH)

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

EACH OCCURRENCE $
DAMAGE TO RENTED

$PREMISES (Ea occurrence)CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR

MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GENERAL AGGREGATE $GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG $

$

PRO-

OTHER:

LOCJECT

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
$(Ea accident)

BODILY INJURY (Per person) $ANY AUTO
OWNED SCHEDULED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) $AUTOS ONLY AUTOS

AUTOS ONLY
HIRED PROPERTY DAMAGE $

AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)

$

OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE $

CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $

DED RETENTION $ $
PER OTH-
STATUTE ER

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $
If yes, describe under

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

POLICY

NON-OWNED

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE    EXPIRATION   DATE    THEREOF,    NOTICE   WILL   BE   DELIVERED   IN
ACCORDANCE   WITH   THE   POLICY   PROVISIONS.

THIS  IS  TO  CERTIFY  THAT  THE  POLICIES  OF  INSURANCE  LISTED  BELOW  HAVE BEEN ISSUED  TO THE  INSURED  NAMED ABOVE  FOR THE  POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.   NOTWITHSTANDING  ANY   REQUIREMENT,  TERM  OR  CONDITION OF  ANY  CONTRACT OR  OTHER  DOCUMENT  WITH  RESPECT  TO  WHICH  THIS
CERTIFICATE  MAY  BE  ISSUED  OR  MAY  PERTAIN,   THE  INSURANCE  AFFORDED  BY  THE  POLICIES  DESCRIBED  HEREIN  IS  SUBJECT  TO  ALL  THE  TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS  AND  CONDITIONS  OF  SUCH  POLICIES.   LIMITS  SHOWN  MAY  HAVE  BEEN  REDUCED  BY  PAID  CLAIMS.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORDACORD 25 (2016/03)

ACORDTM CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

Donegal Insurance Group

02/05/2019

INSPRO Insurance
P.O. Box 6847
Lincoln, NE  68506
402 483-4500

Shane Elwood
402.483.4500 402.483.7977

selwood@insproins.com

Silver Ridge Construction, Inc.
PO Box 22812
Lincoln, NE  68542

14389

A X
X

X PD Ded:250

X

X CPR8161715 12/14/2018 12/14/2019 1,000,000
100,000
5,000
1,000,000
2,000,000
2,000,000

A
X

X X

CLR8161715 12/14/2018 12/14/2019 1,000,000

A CXR8161715 12/14/2018 12/14/2019 5,000,000

A

Y

X WCA8161715 12/14/2018 12/14/2019 X
500,000

500,000
500,000

City of Lincoln and/or Lancaster County and/or City of Lincoln/Lancaster County Public Building Commission
are listed as additionally insured.

City of Lincoln and/or Lancaster
Co. and/or City of Lincoln/
Lancaster Co. PBC
555  10th St, Lincoln, NE  68508

1 of 1
#S1058323/M1031425

SILVE8Client#: 60307

SME




POLICY NUMBER: COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY
CG 20 10 10 01

THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY.  PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.

ADDITIONAL INSURED – OWNERS, LESSEES OR
CONTRACTORS – SCHEDULED PERSON OR

ORGANIZATION

This endorsement modifies insurance provided under the following:

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY COVERAGE PART

SCHEDULE

Name of Person or Organization:

(If no entry appears above, information required to complete this endorsement will be shown in the Declarations as 
applicable to this endorsement.)

A. Section II – Who Is An Insured  is amended to 
include as an insured the person or organization 
shown in the Schedule, but only with respect to li-
ability arising out of your ongoing operations per-
formed for that insured. 

B. With respect to the insurance afforded to these
additional insureds, the following exclusion is
added:

2. Exclusions

This insurance does not apply to "bodily injury"
or "property damage" occurring after:

(1) All work, including materials, parts or
equipment furnished in connection with 
such work, on the project (other than
service, maintenance or repairs) to be
performed by or on behalf of the addi-
tional insured(s) at the site of the cov-
ered operations has been completed; or 

(2) That portion of "your work" out of which 
the injury or damage arises has been
put to its intended use by any person or 
organization other than another
contractor or subcontractor engaged in 
performing operations for a principal as 
a part of the same project. 

CG 20 10 10 01 © ISO Properties, Inc., 2000 Page 1 of 1

 CPR8161715

City of Lincoln and/or Lancaster County and/or Public Building

Commission, 555 S 10th St Ste 203, Lincoln, NE 68508



WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS LIABILITY INSURANCE POLICY WC 00 03 13

(Ed. 4-84)

WAIVER OF OUR RIGHT TO RECOVER FROM OTHERS ENDORSEMENT

We have the right to recover our payments from anyone liable for an injury covered by this policy. We will not enforce
our right against the person or organization named in the Schedule. (This agreement applies only to the extent that
you perform work under a written contract that requires you to obtain this agreement from us.)

This agreement shall not operate directly or indirectly to benefit anyone not named in the Schedule.

Schedule

City of Lincoln and/or Lancaster County and/or Public Building Commission, 555 S 10th St

Lincoln, NE 68508

This endorsement changes the policy to which it is attached and is effective on the date issued unless otherwise stated.

(The information below is required only when this endorsement is issued subsequent to preparation of the policy.)

WCA8161715.
Endorsement Silver Ridge Const., Inc. Effective po"cy No- EndorsementNO;
Insured -••--• ...-a- --..-.., ...-. ^ Premium

,^-Insurance Company Donegal Insurance Countersigned by_

WC 00 03 13
(Ed. 4-84)

© 1983 National Council on Compensation Insurance.
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