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AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
A&J Donner Construction, Inc. 

This Amendment is hereby entered into by and between A&J Donner Construction, Inc., 2511 S. 78th St., 
Lincoln, NE  68506 (hereinafter “Contractor”) and the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and the City of Lincoln-
Lancaster County Public Building Commission (hereinafter “Owners”), for the purpose of amending the Contract 
dated March 2, 2017 executed under City Resolution No. 90268, and County Contract C-17-0069, dated February 
14, 2017, and executed by the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission, on February 14, 
2017, for Unit Price – Pavement/Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285, which is made a part of this amendment by 
this reference.  

WHEREAS, the original term of the Contract is March 1, 2017 through February 28, 2019, with 
the option to renew for two (2) additional two (2) year terms upon written mutual consent by all parties; and 

WHEREAS, the parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1, 
2019 through February 28, 2021; and  

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect price changes and additional line items as 
listed on Quotation Sheet (per Attachment 1). 

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$230,000.00 for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$50,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the 
term of this renewal shall not exceed $20,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public Building 
Commission; and  

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the 
following language:  

OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that “Owner/s” shall include the 
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building 
Commission.  Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the County” or “Building 
Commission”) in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders, specifications, insurance 
requirements, bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents which are a part of the 
Contract, it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and 
the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, the 
duties and obligations of the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County 
Public Building Commission pursuant to the Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable 
duties and obligations, and default by any one of the Owners shall not be attributed to any other 
of the Owners, but shall remain the sole obligation of the defaulting entity. 
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NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants contained in the Contract under City 
Resolution 90268 and County Contract C-17-0069, all amendments thereto, and as stated herein, the parties 
agree as follows: 

1) The parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1,
2019 through February 28, 2021.

2) The parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect price changes and additional line items as listed
on Quotation Sheet (per Attachment 1).

3) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $230,000.00
for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln.

4) The expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $50,000.00
for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board.

5) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the
term of this renewal shall not exceed $20,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public
Building Commission.

6) The parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the
following language:  OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that
“Owner/s” shall include the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County
Public Building Commission.  Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the
County” or “Building Commission”) in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders,
specifications, insurance requirements, bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents
which are a part of the Contract, it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln,
Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building
Commission.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, the duties and obligations of the City of Lincoln,
Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission pursuant to the
Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable duties and obligations, and default by any
one of the Owners shall not be attributed to any other of the Owners, but shall remain the sole
obligation of the defaulting entity.

7) All other terms of the Contract, not in conflict with this Amendment, shall remain in force and
effect.

The Parties do hereby agree to all the terms and conditions of this Amendment.  This Amendment shall 
be binding upon the parties, their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal representatives, 
successors, and assigns. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties do hereby execute this Amendment upon completion of 
signatures on: 

Vendor Signature Page 
City of Lincoln Signature Page 
Lancaster County Signature Page 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission Signature Page     
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City of Lincoln Signature Page 

___________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
A&J Donner Construction, Inc. 

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

ATTEST: 

___________________________________ 
City Clerk  

CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

__________________________________________ 
Chris Beutler, Mayor 

Approved by Executive Order No._______________ 

dated _____________________________________ 
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      Lancaster County Signature Page 

____________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Pavement/Concrete Services 
Bid No. 16-285 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Changes and Additional Line Items 
A&J Donner Construction, Inc. 

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA 

The Board of County Commissioners of 
Lancaster, Nebraska 

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

dated _________________________________ 

Contract Approved as to Form: 

______________________________________ 
Deputy Lancaster County Attorney 

C-19-0134



Attachment 1

Date:                                 
TO DEPARTMENT/AGENCY REPRESENTATIVE:                                                                         

AWARD LEVEL:     3
PROJECT DESCRIPTION:                                                                                                              

TIME OF COMPLETION

EQUIPMENT AND MATERIAL COSTS
ITEM COST Estimated Total

Total Rental Equipment Costs
Total Materials Cost
Total Shipping/Freight Cost

MOBILIZATION
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

 Mobilization - Equipment and Labor $250.00 LS

SCHEDULE I - CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

1.  Type "A" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $7.00 LF
2.  Type "B" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $7.00 LF
3.  Type "C" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $7.00 LF
4.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal $13.50 CY
5.  Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $3.50 SF
6.  Concrete Sidewalk, 7" Thick $4.75 SF
7.  Concrete Sidewalk, 9" Thick $5.75 SF
8.  Concrete Sidewalk, 10" Thick $5.90 SF
9.  Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $3.75 SF
10.  Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $4.00 SF
11.  Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $4.50 SF
12.  Detectable Warning Panel $45.00 SF
13.  Remove Concrete Sidwalk, 4" Thick $1.50 SF
14.  Remove Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $1.65 SF
15.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $1.80 SF
16.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $2.25 SF
17.  Sub-Grade Preparation $9.00 SY
18.  5" Concrete Base (L-5500) $4.00 SY
19.  8" Concrete Base (L-5500) $5.75 SY
20.  Tie Bars $2.00 EA
21.  Surface Milling No bid SY
22.  24" Curb and Gutter $25.00 LF
23.  Adjust Manhold to Grade $250.00 LS
24.  Adjust Water Valve Box to Grade $150.00 LS
25.  Remove & Reset Storm Inlet Top $350.00 LS
26.  Install & Remove Curb Inlet Filters $25.00 LS
27.  Parking Space Finish (Minor grading and preparing the 
area between the sidewalk and curb for either seed / sod $9.00 SY

% of Markup
10%
10%

This Document Is Required For All Unit Price Projects

Number of Days to Complete

FROM (CONTRACTOR):  A & J Donner Construction                   

CITY OF LINCOLN, LANCASTER COUNTY, CITY OF LINCOLN-LANCASTER                        
COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION                                                    

UNIT PRICE QUOTATION

Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285

Fill in the following Tables in the areas as shown.      If an item does not apply, please do not make an entry in that column. 
                                                                                                                                                                 

Estimated Start Date

1 Revised 1/10/2019
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28.  Modular Block Retaining Wall (Based on total area of 
the retaining wall installed) No bid SF
29.  Seeding No bid SF
30.  Sodding No bid SF
Total

SCHEDULE II -  ASPHALTIC CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quanitity Estimated Total

1.  Type "A" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement No bid LF
2.  Type "D" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement No bid LF
3.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal No bid CY
4.  Install Asphaltic Concrete Curb No bid LF
5.  Remove Asphaltic Concrete Curb No bid LF
6.  Install Concrete Curb No bid LF
7.  Remove Concrete Curb $20.00 LF
8. Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Class 2, Non-Arterial 
Streets & Parking Area No bid SY
10.  Asphaltic Concrete Resurfacing No bid TON
11.  Paint Pavement Marking with Glass Beads No bid LF
12.  Paint Pavement Marking, without Glass Beads No bid LF
13. Street Patching, 6" Thick No bid SF
14. Street Patching, 8" Thick No bid SF
15.  Alternate Sidewalk Repairs No bid Inch-Foot
Total

SUBCONTRACTORS COSTS
SUB-CONTRACTOR (NAME) COST % of Markup Estimated Total

Sub No. 1 10%
Sub No. 2 10%

FIRM:                                                                                APPROVED BY:___________________
BY:                                                                                      Department Agency/Rep

ADDRESS:                                                                        PHONE NO:______________________

                                                                                          DATE:___________________________

 $ TOTAL ESTIMATED COST -- NOT TO EXCEED:

Change Order #: __________________
Accepted:_______________________
Not Accepted :___________________

2 Revised 1/10/2019

















SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

INSURER F :

INSURER E :

INSURER D :

INSURER C :

INSURER B :

INSURER A :

NAIC #

NAME:
CONTACT

(A/C, No):
FAX

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

PRODUCER

(A/C, No, Ext):
PHONE

INSURED

REVISION NUMBER:CERTIFICATE NUMBER:COVERAGES

IMPORTANT:  If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement.  A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW.  THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

OTHER:

(Per accident)

(Ea accident)

$

$

N / A

SUBR
WVD

ADDL
INSD

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.  NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

$

$

$

$PROPERTY DAMAGE

BODILY INJURY (Per accident)

BODILY INJURY (Per person)

COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

AUTOS ONLY

AUTOSAUTOS ONLY
NON-OWNED

SCHEDULEDOWNED

ANY AUTO

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Y / N

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandatory in NH)

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below
If yes, describe under

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE

$

$

$

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

ER
OTH-

STATUTE
PER

LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EXP

(MM/DD/YYYY)
POLICY EFF

POLICY NUMBERTYPE OF INSURANCELTR
INSR

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

EXCESS LIAB

UMBRELLA LIAB $EACH OCCURRENCE

$AGGREGATE

$

OCCUR

CLAIMS-MADE

DED RETENTION $

$PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG

$GENERAL AGGREGATE

$PERSONAL & ADV INJURY

$MED EXP (Any one person)

$EACH OCCURRENCE
DAMAGE TO RENTED

$PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

POLICY
PRO-
JECT LOC

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

CANCELLATION

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

HIRED
AUTOS ONLY

8/9/2018

The Harry A Koch Co of Lincoln
233 S 13th Street
Suite 1650
Lincoln NE 68508-NE

402-435-7100

First Dakota Indemnity Company
AJD31685 United Fire & Casualty 13021

A & J Donner Construction, Inc.
2511 S 78 St
Lincoln NE 68506

18575756

B X 1,000,000

X 100,000

5,000

1,000,000

2,000,000

X

60494112 5/12/2018 5/12/2019

2,000,000

B 1,000,000

X
60494112 5/12/2018 5/12/2019

B X 5,000,00060494112 5/12/2018 5/12/2019

5,000,000

A XWC02000272312018A 5/12/2018 5/12/2019

1,000,000

1,000,000

1,000,000

RE: All Projects and Operations of Contractor
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and Lincoln-Lancaster Public Building Commission are additional insured for general liability, including products and
completed operations, if required by written contract executed prior to loss. Primary & noncontributory status is governed by the terms & conditions of the
insurance policies of all parties to the contract. Also additional insured for auto liability if required by written contract executed prior to loss. Waiver of
Subrogation applies for Workers' Compensation if required by written contract executed prior to loss.
The policies have been endorsed to provide 30 days notice of cancellation, except for cancellation for nonpayment of premium, in which case 10 days notice of
cancellation will be provided.

City of Lincoln
Lancaster County
Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Bldg Commissio
555 S 10th St
Lincoln NE 68508



WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS LIABILITY INSURANCE POLICY WC 99 06 50
(Ed. 01/10)

WC 99 06 50
Ed. 01/10

NOTICE TO OTHERS OF CANCELLATION

This endorsement applies if we cancel this policy or make changes that reduce the insurance afforded by this policy for any
reason other than nonpayment of premium. We will mail or deliver a copy of notice of cancellation or reduction to those listed
in the schedule below at least 30 days before the effective date of the cancellation or reduction

Name Address
Board of Regnets of the University of Nebraska-Lincoln 1901 Y ST

LINCOLN, NE 68588-0605

Morton Buildings Inc PO BOX 399
MORTON, IL 61550

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and Lincoln-
Lancaster County Public Building Commission

555 S 10TH ST
LINCOLN, NE 68508

This endorsement changes the policy to which it is attached and is effective on the date issued unless otherwise stated.

(The information below is required only when this endorsement is issued subsequent to preparation of the policy.)

Policy No: WC020-0027231-2018A
Endorsement Effective: 5/12/2018

Insured: A & J Donner Construction Inc
Insurance Company: First Dakota Indemnity Company

Countersigned by
























