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AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services 
Bid No. 16-284 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Increase 
Hy-Electric, Inc. 

This Amendment is hereby entered into by and between Hy-Electric, Inc., 4590 N. 48th St., Lincoln, NE 
68504 (hereinafter “Contractor”) and the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and the City of Lincoln-Lancaster 
County Public Building Commission (hereinafter “Owners”), for the purpose of amending the Contract dated 
March 2, 2017 executed under City Resolution No. A-90262, and County Contract C-17-0139, dated February 
21, 2017, and executed by the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission, on February 14, 
2017, for Unit Price – Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services, Bid No. 16-284, which is made a part of this 
amendment by this reference.  

WHEREAS, the original term of the Contract is March 1, 2017 through February 28, 2019, with 
the option to renew for two (2) additional two (2) year terms upon written mutual consent by all parties; and 

WHEREAS, the parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1, 
2019 through February 28, 2021; and 

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect a price increase as listed on Unit Price 
Quotation Sheet, per Attachment 1; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$240,000.00 for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed 
$120,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board; and  

WHEREAS, the expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the 
term of this renewal shall not exceed $60,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public Building 
Commission; and  

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the 
following language:  

OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that “Owner/s” shall include the 
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission. 
Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the County” or “Building Commission”) 
in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders, specifications, insurance requirements, 
bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents which are a part of the Contract, it shall 
mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-
Lancaster County Public Building Commission.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, the duties and 
obligations of the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public 
Building Commission pursuant to the Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable duties 
and obligations, and default by any one of the Owners shall not be attributed to any other of the 
Owners, but shall remain the sole obligation of the defaulting entity. 

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants contained in the Contract under City 
Resolution A-90262 and County Contract C-17-0139, all amendments thereto, and as stated herein, the parties 
agree as follows: 
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1) The parties hereby renew the Contract for an additional two (2) year term beginning March 1,
2019 through February 28, 2021.

2) The parties hereby amend the Contract to reflect a price increase as listed on Unit Price
Quotation Sheet, per Attachment 1.

3) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $240,000.00
for contracts without approval by the City of Lincoln.

4) The expenditures for Lancaster County for the term of this renewal shall not exceed $120,000.00
for contracts without approval by the Lancaster County Board.

5) The expenditures for the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission for the
term of this renewal shall not exceed $60,000.00 for contracts without approval by the Public
Building Commission.

6) The parties hereby amend the contract to replace Paragraph No. 9 of the Contract with the
following language:  OWNER INCLUSION. It is understood and agreed by all parties that
“Owner/s” shall include the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County
Public Building Commission.  Whenever a singular entity is referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the
County” or “Building Commission”) in the Contract, which includes the instructions to bidders,
specifications, insurance requirements, bonds, terms and conditions, or any other documents
which are a part of the Contract, it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of Lincoln,
Lancaster County, and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission.
Notwithstanding the foregoing, the duties and obligations of the City of Lincoln, Lancaster County,
and the Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission pursuant to the Contract shall be
treated as divisible and severable duties and obligations, and default by any one of the Owners
shall not be attributed to any other of the Owners, but shall remain the sole obligation of the
defaulting entity.

7) All other terms of the Contract, not in conflict with this Amendment, shall remain in force and
effect.

The Parties do hereby agree to all the terms and conditions of this Amendment.  This Amendment shall 
be binding upon the parties, their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal representatives, 
successors, and assigns. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties do hereby execute this Amendment upon completion of 
signatures on: 

Vendor Signature Page 
City of Lincoln Signature Page 
Lancaster County Signature Page 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission Signature Page     
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Vendor Signature Page

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT
Unit Price

Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services
Bid No. 16-284

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission

Renewal with Price Increase
Hy-Electric, Inc.

Please sign, date and return within 5 days of receipt.

Mail to: City/County Purchasing
Attn: Brianne Crooks
440 So. 8th St., Ste. 200
Lincoln, NE 68508
Or email to: bcrooks@lincoln.ne.gov
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Tracking No. 19020025 

City of Lincoln Signature Page 

___________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services 
Bid No. 16-284 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Increase 
Hy-Electric, Inc. 

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

ATTEST: 

___________________________________ 
City Clerk  

CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 

__________________________________________ 
Chris Beutler, Mayor 

Approved by Executive Order No._______________ 

dated _____________________________________ 
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      Lancaster County Signature Page 

____________________________________________________________________________ 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services 
Bid No. 16-284 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Increase 
Hy-Electric, Inc. 

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA 

The Board of County Commissioners of 
Lancaster, Nebraska 

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

dated _________________________________ 

Contract Approved as to Form: 

______________________________________ 
Deputy Lancaster County Attorney 

C-19-0131
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City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 
Signature Page 

 
 

___________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT 
Unit Price 

Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services 
Bid No. 16-284 

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission 

Renewal with Price Increase 
Hy-Electric, Inc. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

EXECUTION BY LINCOLN-LANCASTER COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION 
 
 
 

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
______________________________________     ____________________________________ 
Public Building Commission Attorney   Chairperson, Public Building Commission 
 
 
       dated _______________________________ 

 
 
 

 
        



Attachment 1

Date:                                 
TO DEPARTMENT/AGENCY REPRESENTATIVE:                                                                        
FROM (CONTRACTOR):                               Hy-Electric, Inc.      AWARD LEVEL: 3
PROJECT DESCRIPTION:                                                                                                               

TIME OF COMPLETION

ELECTRICAL LABOR COST TABLE
CONTRACTOR per hr. rate Estimated # Hours Estimated Total

Supervisor, Superintendent or Foreman $70.00
Master Electrician $70.00
Electrician $70.00
Apprentice $38.00
Laborer $25.00
TOTAL LABOR

LARGE SCALE ELECTRICAL LABOR COST TABLE
CONTRACTOR per hr. rate Estimated # Hours Estimated Total

Supervisor, Superintendent or Foreman - Large Scale No Bid
Master Electrician - Large Scale No Bid
Electrician Large Scale No Bid
Apprentice - Large Scale No Bid
Laborer - Large Scale No Bid
TOTAL LABOR

EQUIPMENT AND MATERIAL COSTS
ITEM COST % of Markup Estimated Total

Total Rental Equipment Costs 15%
Total Materials Cost 20%
Total Shipping/Freight Cost

SUBCONTRACTORS COSTS
SUB-CONTRACTOR (NAME) COST % of Markup Estimated Total

Sub No. 1 10%
Sub No. 2 10%

FIRM:                                                                                  APPROVED BY:__________________
BY:                                                                                       Department Agency/Rep

ADDRESS:                                                                         PHONE NO:_____________________
                                                                                            DATE:__________________________

This Document Is Required For All Unit Price Projects

Number of Days to Complete

$TOTAL ESTIMATED COST -- NOT TO EXCEED:

CITY OF LINCOLN, LANCASTER COUNTY, CITY OF LINCOLN-LANCASTER                    
COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION                                                

UNIT PRICE QUOTATION

Unit Price - Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services, Bid No. 16-284

Fill in the following Tables in the areas as shown.      If an item does not apply, please do not make an entry in that column. 
                                                                                                                                                                 

Estimated Start Date

1 Revised 11/21/2016



Attachment 1

Change Order #: __________________
Accepted:_______________________
Not Accepted :___________________

2 Revised 11/21/2016



Performance Bond
Bond GRNE 43779

Any singular reference to Contractor, Surety, Owner or other party shall be considered plural where applicable,

CONTRACTOR (Name and Address): SURETY (Name and Principal Place of Business):

Hy-Electric Inc.

4590 N 48th St
Lincoln, NE 68504-1414

Granite Re, Inc.

14001 Quailbrook Dr
Oklahoma City, OK 73134

OWNER (Name and Address):

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission
555 S 10th Street Lincoln, NE 68508

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
Date; 3/1/2017
Amount! Fifty Thousand And No/100 ($50,000.00)
Description (Name and Location):

For all labor, material and equipment necessary for Unit Price - Electrical and Large Scale Electrical Services,
Bid No. 16-284. (For the term of the Contract March 1,2019 through February 28, 2021)

BOND
Date (Not earlier than Construction Contract Date): 3/1/2019
Amount; Fifty Thousand And No/100 ($50,000.00)
Modifications to this Bond Form: None

Hy-EIectric Inc.

CONTRACTOR AS PRINCIPAL
Company

Signature;
Name and Tifef

(Corp. Sgal)

7"

Granite Re, Inc.

SURETY
Company

Signature;, /
-^.

(Corp, Seal)

Name and Title:Thomas L. King Attoi-ney-in-Fact

EJCDCNo. 1910-28A (1984 Edition)
Prepared Bu'ough the joint efforts of the Surety Association ofAmctica. Engineers' Joint Contract Documents Committee, The Associated
General Contractors of America, and the American Institute of Architects.
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I, The Contractor and the Surety, jointly and severally, bind themselves, their
heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns to the Owner for the

performance of the Construction Contract, which is incorporated herein by
reference,

2, If the Contractor performs the Construciion Contract, the Surety and the
Contractor shall have no obligation under this Bond, except to participate in
conferences as provided in Subparagraph 3,1.

3, If there is no Owner Default, the Surety's obligation under this Bond shall
arise after;

3,1, The Owner has notified the Contractor aud the Surety at its address
described in Paragraph 10 below, that the Owtisr Is considering
declaring a Contractor Default and has requested and attempted to
arrange a conference with the Contractor and the Surety to be held
not later than fifteen days after receipt of such notice to discuss
methods of performing the Coustmctlon Contract. If {he Owner,
ths Contractor aud the Surety ngree, the Contractor shall bo
allowed a reasonable time to perform the Construction Contract,
but such an agreement shall not waive the Owner's right, if any,
subsequently to declare a Contractor Default; aud

3,2. The Owner has declared a Contractor Default and formally
terminftted the Contractor's right to complete the contract. Such
Contractor Default shall not be declared earlier than twenty days
after the Contractor and the Surety have received notice as
provided in Subparagraph 3. 1; and

3.3, The Owner has agreed to pay the Balance of the Contract Price to
tho Surety in accordance with tho terms of the Construction Contract
or to a contractor selected to perfbtm the Construction Contract in
accorditttce with the terms of the contract with the Owner.

4, When the Owner has Ratisfled the conditions of Paragrapli 3, the Surety
shall promptly and at the Surety's expense take one of the following actions;

4.1, Arrange for the Contractor, with consent of the Owner, to perfoim
and complete the Construction Contract; or

4,2, Undertake to perform and complete the Coustruction Contract itself,
through its agents or through independent contractors; or

4,3. Obtain bids or negotiated proposals from qualified contractors
acceptable to the Owner for a contract for petformuice and
completion of the Construction Contract, arrange for a contract to be

prepared for execution by (lie Owner and the contractor selected
witli the Owner's concurrence, to be secured with perfomiance and

payment bonds executed by a qualified surety equivalent to the
bonds issued on the Construction Conhact, and pay to the Owner tlie
amount of damages us described in Paragraph 6 in excess of the
Balftnco of the Contract Price iucui'ted by the Owner resulting from
the Contractor's default, or

4.4. Waive its right to perform and complete, arrange for completion, or
obtain a new contractor and with reasonable promptness under the
circumstances;

1, After investigation, detetmine the amount for which it may be
liable to the Owner and, as sooti as practicable after the amount
ia determined, tender payment therefor to the Owner; or

2, Deny liaUlity in whole or in part and notify the Owner citing
reasons therefor.

5, If die Surety does not proceed as provided in Paragraph 4 with reasonable
promplness, the Surety shall be deemed to be in default on this Bond fifteen
days after receipt of an additional written notice from the Owner to ttie Surety
demanding that the Surety perform its oUigations under this Bond, and the
Owner shall be entitled to enforce any remedy available to the Owner. If the
Surety proceeds as provided in Subparagraph 4.4, and the Owner refuses the
payment tendered or the Surety has denied liability, ia whole or in part,
without Airthcr notice the Owner shall be entitled to enforce any remedy
available to the Owner,

6, After the Owner has terminated the Contractor's right to complete the
Construction Contract, and if the Surety elects to act under Subparagraph 4.1,

4.2, or 4.3 above, then the responsibilities of the Surety to the Owner shall not
be greater than those of the Contractor under the Conatmction Contract, and
the responsibilities of the Owner to the Surety shall not be greater than those
of the Owner under the Construction Contract, To the limit of the amount of
this Bond, but subject to commitment by the Owner of the Balance of the
Contract Price to mitigation of costs and damages on the Construction
Contract, the Surety is obligated without duplication for;

6,1. The responsibilities of the Contractor for correction of defective
work and completion of the Construction Contract;

6,2, Additional legal, design professional aud delay costs resulting from
the Contractor's Default, and resulting from the actions or failure to
act of the Surety under Paragraph 4; and

6.3, Liquidated damages, or if no liquidated damages are specified in the
Construction Contract, actual damages caused by delayed
perfonnaitce or ncm-performance of the Contractor,

7, The Surety shnll not be liable to the Owner or others for obligation;! of the
Contractor that are unrelated to the Construction Contract, and the Balance of
the Contract Price shall not be reduced oc set off on account of any such
um.'elated obligations. No right of action ahall accrue on this Bond to any
person or entity other than the Owner or its heirs. executors, admiulstrators, or

successors,

8. The Surety hereby waives notice of any change, including changes of time,
to tlie Construction Contract or to related subcontracts, purchase orders and
other obligations,

9. Any proceeding, legal or equitable, under this Bond may be instituted in
any court of competent jurisdicdou in the location in which the work or part
of the work is located and shall be instituted within two years after Conb-actor
Default or within two years after the Contractor ceased working or within two
years after the Surety refuses or fails to perform its obligations under this
Bond, whichever occurs first. If the provisions of this Paragraph are void or
prohibited by law, the minimum period of limitation available to sureties as a
defense in the jurisdiction of the suit shall be applicable.

10, Notice to the Swety> the Owner or the Contractor shall bo mailed or
delivered to the address shown on the signature page.

11. When tills Bond has been furnislied to comply with a statutory or other
legal requirement in the location where ths construction was to be performed,
any provision in this Bond conflicting with said statutoiy or legal requirement
shall be deemed deleted herafrom and provisions conformiag to such
statutory or other legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated horeiu. The
intent is that this Bond shall be construed as a statutory bond and not as a
common law bond,

12. Definitions.

12,1. Balance of the Contract Price: The total amount payable by the
Owner to the Contractor under the Cojutruction Contract after all
proper adjustments have been made, including allowance to the
Contractor of any amounts received or to be received by the Owaer
in settlement of insurance'or other claims for damages to which the
Contractor is entitled, reduced by all valid and proper payments
made to or on behalf of the Contractor under the Construction
Contract,

12.2. Construction Contract; The agreement between the Owucr and the
Contractor ideattfled ou the sigiiaftu'e page, including all Contract
Documents aad changes thereto.

12.3, Contractor Default: Failure of the Contractor, which has neither
been remedied nor waived, to perform or otherwise to comply with
fte tettns of the Conatmctloti Contmct,

12.4. Owner Default: Pailucc of the Owner, which has neither been
remedied nor waived, to pay the Contractor as required by the
Construction Contract or to perform and complete or comply with
the other terms thereof.

(FOR INFORMATION ONLY-Name, Address and Telephone)
AGENT or BROKER;
Gene Lilly Surety Bonds, Inc., 735 S, 56"' Street
Lincoln, NE 68510 (402)475-7700
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Bond GRNE 43779

Payment Bond

Any singular reference to Contractor, Surety, Owner or other party shall be considered plural where applicable.

CONTRACTOR (Name and Address): SURETY (Name and Principal Place of Business);

Hy-Electric Inc.

4590 N 48th St

Lincoln, NE 68504-1414

Granite Re, Inc.

14001 Quailbrook Dr

Oklahoma City, OK 73134

OWNER (Name and Address):

City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission

555 S 10th Street Lincoln, NE 68508

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT
Date; 3/1/2017
Amoimt: Fifty Thousand And No/100 ($50,000.00)
Description (Name and Location);

For all labor, material and equipment necessary for Unit Price - Electrical and Large Scale Electrical
Services, Bid No. 16-284. (For the term of the Contract March 1, 2019 through February 28,2021)

BOND
Date (Not earlier than Construction Contract Date): 3/1/2019
Amount! Fifty Thousand And No/100 ($50,000.00)
Modifications to this Bond Form: None

Hy-Electric Inc.

CONTRACTOR AS PRINCIPAL
Company

Signature:

(Corp, Seal)

Nnaie and Title;'

Granite Re, Inc.
SURETY

Company

Signature; J_
"^.

(Corp. Seal)

Name and Title: Thomas L. King Attomey-in-Pact

ETCDCNo. 1910-28B (1984 Edition)
Prepared flirough thojoiat efforts of the Surety Association of America, Engineers' Joint Contract Documents Committee, Tlie Associated
General Contractors of America, American Institute ofArdutects, American Subcontractors Association, and the Associated Specialty
Contracto's.

Reprinted 10/90
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1. The Contractor and the Surety, jointly and ssvcrally, bind themselves, their
heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns to the Owner to pay

for labor, materials and equipment flirnished for use in the performaucs of the
Consti'uctiott Contract, which is incorporated herein by reference,

2, With respect to the Owner, this obligation shall be null and void if the
Contractor:

2.1, Promptly makes pByment, directly or iiidireclly, for all sums due
Claimants, and

2,2, Defends, indemnifies and holds harmless the Owner fiom all claims,
demands, liens or suits by any person or entity whose claim, demand,
lien or suit is for payment for labor, materials 01 equipment furnished
for use in the perfofmance of the Constmctioti Contract, provided the
Owner has promptly notified the Contractor and the Surety (at the
address described in Paragraph 12) of any claims, demands, liens or
suits and tendered defense of such claims, demands, liens or suits to the
Contractor and the Surety, and provided there is no Owner Default.

3. With respect to Claimants, this obligation shall be null and void if the
Contractor promptly makes payment, directly or indirectly, for all sums due,

4, The Surety shiill have no obligation to Claimants under this Bond until;
4,1, Claimants who are employed by or have a direct contract with the

Contractor have given notice to the Surety (at the address described ia
Paragraph 12) and sent a copy, or notice thereof to the Owner, stating
that a claim is being made under this Bond and, with substantial
accuracy, the amount of the claim.

4.2. Claimants who do not have a direct contract with the Contractor;
1, Have ftu'uished written notice to the Contractor and sent a copy, or
notice thereof, to the Owner, within 90 days after having last
performed labor or last furnished materials or equipment included in
the claim stating, with substaadal accuracy, the amoimt of the claim
and the name of the party to whom the materials were furnished or
supplied or for whom the labor was done or performed; and
2. I-Iavo either received a rejection in whole or in part fl-om the

Coutr(ictor> or not received within 30 days of furnishing the above
notice any communication from the Contractor by which die
Contractor has indicated tho claim will be paid directly or indirectly;
and
3. Not having been paid within the above 30 days, have sent a written
notice to (lie Surety (at the address described in Paragraph 12) and sent
a copy, or notice thereof. to the Owner, stating that a claim is being
made under this Bond and enclosing a copy of the previous written
notice furnished to the Contractor,

5. If a notice requu'ed by Paragraph 4 is given by the Owuer to (he Contractor
or to the Surety, tliflt is sufficient compliance.

6. When the Claimant has satisfied the conditions of Paragraph 4, the Surety
shall promptly and at the Surety's expense take the following actions;

6.1, Send an ntiswer to the Claimant, with a copy to the Owner. Within 45
days after receipt of the claim, stating the amounts that are undisputed
and the basis for ohallengiug any amounts that are disputed.

6.2. Pay or arrange for payment of any undisputed amounts.

7, Tlic Surety's total obligation shall not exceed the amount of this Bond, and
the amount of this Bond shall be credited for any payments made in good
faith by the Surety.

8. Amounts owed by the Owner to the Contractor under the Construction

Contract shall bo used for the pecformance of the Constmction. Contract and to
satisfy claims, if any, under any Cousti-uction Performance Bond, By the
Contractor furnishmg and the Owner accepting this Bond, they agree that all

fUnds enmed by the Contractor in die performance of Construction Contract
are dedicated to satisfy obligations of the Contractor and the Surety under this
Bond subject to the Owner's priority to use the fiinds for the completion of the
work.

9. The Surety shall not be liable to the Owner, Claimants or others for
obligations of the Contractor that are unrelated to the Constmction Contract.
The Owner shall not be liable for payment of any costs or expense of any
Claimant under this Bond, and shall have under this Bond no obligations to
make payments to, give notices on behalf of, or otherwise have obligations to
Claimants under this Bond.

10, The Surety hereby waives notice of any change, including changes of
time, to the Construction Contract or to related subcontracts, purchase orders
and other obligations.

11, No suit or action shall be commenced by a Claimant under this Bond
other than in a court of competent jurisdiction in die location in which the
work or part of the work is located or after the expiration of on® year from the
date (1) on which the Claimant gave the notice required by Subparagraph 4,1
or Clause 4.2 (iii), or (2) on which the last labor service was performed by
anyone or the last materials or equipment we furnished by anyone under the
Construction Contt'aot, whichever of (1) or (2) first occurs. If the provisions
of this Paragraph are void or prohibited by law, the minimum period of
limitation available to sureties as a defense in the jurisdiction of the suit shall
be applicable,

12. Notice to the Surety, the Owner or the Contractor shall be mailed or
delivered to the address showu on the signature page. Actual receipt of notice
by Surety, tlie Owner or the Contractor, however accomplislied, sliftll be
sufficient compliance as of die date received at the address shown on the
signature page.

13. When this Bond has been furnished to comply with a statutory or other
legal requkement in the lactttion where the construction was to be performed,
auy provision in this Bond conflicting with said statutory or legal requiromeut
shall bo deemed deleted herefrom and provisions conforming to such
statutory or other legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated herein. The
intent is, that this Bond shall be constroed as a statutory bond and not as a
common law bond.

14. Upon request by any person or entity appearing to be a 'jMtential
beueficiary of this Bond, the Contractor shall promptly fiimish a copy of this
Bond or shall permit a copy to be made.

15. DEFINITIONS
15.1. ClaimBnt; An individual or entity having a direct contract with the

Contractor or with a sulcontractor of the Contractor to furnish labor,

materials or equipment for use in the perfonnanco of the Contract,
The intent of this Bond shall be to include without limitation in the
terms "lalor, materials or equipment" that part of water, gas, power,

light, heat, oil, gasoline, tolephone service or rental equipment used
in the Construction Contract, architectural and enginooring services
required for performance of the work of the Contractor and the
Contractor's Bubcontractors, and, nil other items for which a

mechanic's lien may tie asserted in the jurisdiction where the labor,
materials or equipment were fiimished,

15,2, Construction Contract; The agreement between the Owner aud the

Contractor identified on the signature page, including all Contract
Documents and changes thereto,

15,3, Owner Default; Failure of the Owner, which has neither been
remedied nor waived, to pay the Contractor as required by the
Construction Contract or to perform and complete or comply with
the other terms thereof,

(FOR INFORMATION ONLY-Name, Address and Telephone)
AGENT or BROKER:
Gene Lilly Surety Bonds, luc, 735 S. 56th Street
Lincoln, NE 68510 (402)475-7700
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GRANITE RE, INC.
GENERAL POWER OF ATTORNEY

Know all Men by these Presents:

That GRANITE RE, INC., a corporation organized and existing under the laws of the State of OKLAHOMA and having Its principal office at the

City of OKLAHOMA CITY in the State of OKLAHOMA does hereby constitute and appoint:

ROBERT T. CIRONE; JAMES M. KING; JACOB J. BUSS; SUZANNE P. WESTERHOLT; THOMAS L. KING its true and lawful Attorney-in-Fact(s) for the

following purposes, to wit:

To sign its name as surety to, and to execute, seal and acknowledge any and all bonds, and to respectively do and perform any and all acts and
things set forth in the resolution of the Board of Directors of the said GRANITE RE, INC. a certified copy of which is hereto annexed and made a part of

this Power of Attorney; and the said GRANITE RE, INC. through us, its Board of Directors, hereby ratifies and confirms all and whatsoever the said:

ROBERT T. CIRONE; JAMES M. KING; JACOB J. BUSS; SUZANNE P. WESTERHOLT; THOMAS L. KING may lawfully do in the premises by virtue of these

presents.

In Witness Whereof, the said GRANITE RE, INC. has caused this instrument to be sealed with its corporate seal, duly attested by the signatures

of its President and Secretary/Treasurer, this 14th day of June, 2017,

ss:

^-*~»_frC<^*«.

Kenneth D. Whittingt^h, President

STATE OF OKLAHOMA ) ^ \^^j Z//^^^
COUNTY OF OKLAHOMA ) '»»m<<^ Kyle P. McDonzild, Treasurer

On this 14th day of June, 2017, before me personally came Kenneth D. Whittington, President of the GRANITE RE, INC. Company and Kyle P.

McDonald, Secretary/Treasurer of said Company, with both of whom I am personally acquainted, who being by me severally duly sworn, said, that

they, the said Kenneth D. Whittington and Kyle P. McDonald were respectively the President and the Secretary/Treasurer of GRANITE RE, INC., the

corporation described in and which executed the foregoing Power of Attorney; that they each knew the seal of said corporation; that the seal affixed

to said Power of Attorney was such corporate seal, that it was so fixed by order of the Board of Directors of said corporation, and that they signed

their name thereto by like order as President and Secretary/Treasurer, respectively, of the Company.

My Commission Expires: ('f.,,,«..,,^"| ' ASC/J^J>

August 8,2021
Commission #: 01013257

GRANITE RE, INC.

Certificate

THE UNDERSIGNED, being the duly elected and acting Secretary/Treasurer of Granite Re, Inc., an Oklahoma Corporation, HEREBY CERTIFIES that the

following resolution is a true and correct excerpt from the July 15,1987, minutes of the meeting of the Board of Directors of Granite Re, Inc. and that

said Power of Attorney has not been revoked and is now in full force and effect.

"RESOLVED, that the President, any Vice President, the Secretary, and any Assistant Vice President shall each have authority to appoint

individuals as attorneys-in-fact or under other appropriate titles with authority to execute on behalf of the company fidelity and surety bonds

and other documents of similar character issued by the Company in the course of its business. On any instrument making or evidencing such

appointment, the signatures may be affixed by facsimile. On any instrument conferring such authority or on any bond or undertaking of the

Company, the seal, or a facsimile thereof, may be impressed or affixed or in any other manner reproduced; provided, however, that the seal
shall not be necessary to the validity of any such instrument or undertaking."

11^ \^iyNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned has^ubscribed this Certificate and affixed the corporate seal of the Corporation this
day of ^\t^d>\ ~ ,20

x.//^^/
Kyle P.-McDonald, Secretary/Treasurer
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Certified Statement Pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. § 77-1323

§ 77-1323 Every person, partnership, limited liability company, association, or corporation furnishing labor
or material in the repair, alteration, improvement, erection, or construction of any public improvement shall
furnish a certified statement to be attached to the contract that all equipment to be used on the project,
except that acquired since the assessment date, has been assessed for taxation for the current year,
giving the county where assessed,

Pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. § 77-1323,1, ??^o \ 'D c^ii-e-A _, do hereby certify that all
equipment to be used on Bid No. 16-284, except that equipment acquired since the assessment date, has
been assessed for taxation for the current year, in County, Nebraska.

DATED this dp day of VaJi^'-^o-ru , 2019.

By:.
^-7°p-^-^

Title: \?<-i^J-a^ ("LjQ^V-

STATE OF NEBRASKA )
)ss.

COUNTf OF UiftCS <nW )

/

On f^>'6-. /.-. y'"1 _, 2019, before me, the updersigned Notary Public duly commissioned
for and qualified in said County, personally came ("''^ru ( ^cli, <'••<•• / to me known to be the
identical person, whose name is affixed to the foregoing instrument and acknowledged the execution
thereof to be his voluntary act and deed,

Witness my hand and notarial seal the day and year last above written.

GENERAL NOTARY - State of Nebraska
GRETCHEN L REETZ
My Comm.Exp.May9,2019

.y-^.^
<' U^t^.W ii7] JLA.

Notary Public
(SEAL)



EMPLOYEE CLASSIFICATION ACT AFFIDAVIT

For the purposes of complying with THE NEBRASKA EMPLOYEE CLASSIFICATION ACT,
Nebraska Revised Statutes 48-2901 to 48-2912,

I, TU 'Sctvff-j^l , herein below known as the Contractor, state under oath and swear as

follows:

1. Each individual performing services for the Contractor is properly classified under the Employee
Classification Act.

2.The Contractor has completed a federal 1-9 immigration form and has such form on file for each

employee performing services.

3. The Contractor has complied with Neb. Rev. Stat. 4-114.

4. The Contractor has no reasonable basis to believe that any individual performing services for the

Contractor is an undocumented worker.

5. The Contractor is not barred from contracting with the state or any political subdivision pursuant to
Neb. Rev. Stat. 48-2912 of this Act.

6. As the Contractor, I understand that pursuant to the Employee Classification Act a violation of the Act
by a contractor is grounds for rescission of the contract by Lancaster County. I understand that pursuant

to the Act any contractor who knowingly provides a false affidavit may be subject to criminal penalties
and upon a second or subsequent violation shall be barred from contracting with Lancaster County for a

period of three years after the date of discovery of the falsehood.

I hereby affirm and swear that the statements and information provided on this affidavit are true,

complete and accurate. The undersigned person does hereby agree and represent that he or she

is legally capable to sign this affidavit and to lawfully bind tt^e Contractor to this affidavit.
PRINT NAME: ~Pc^\ M\-Q^\ 'Oc^^U

SIGNATURE:

TITLE:

State of Nebraska

County ofj_______

Pf-<L^'JL^'V-

)
)ss,

)

(, This affidavit was signed and sworn to before me, the undersigned Notary Public, on this

^day of I- ^l-ML^-f . , 20_,/

'.A,^^\
GENERAL NOTARY • State of Nebraska

GRETPHEN L REE72
MyComm,Exp,May9,2019

Notaiy Public










