
Event Number 18-269 Addendum 4 Organization Lincoln Purchasing

Event Title

Supply and Hauling of Gravel 
Surface Course Material, Spring 
2019 Workgroup Lincoln Purchasing

Event Description  Title should be Fall 2018, not Spring.Ques ons Event Owner Sharon Mulder
Event Type Bid Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
Issue Date 10/19/2018 01:00:01 PM (CT) Phone (402) 441-7428 x
Close Date 11/6/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (402) 441-6513 x

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
R L Tiemann Construction Beatrice NE 11/6/2018 10:34:53 AM (CT) 4 $251,950.00
Buel Trucking, Inc. EAGLE NE 11/6/2018 11:50:53 AM (CT) 7 $588,300.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation Omaha NE 11/6/2018 09:38:18 AM (CT) 10 $796,415.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating Martell NE 11/6/2018 11:55:09 AM (CT) 10 $860,945.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 3000 Tons No Bid
Buel Trucking, Inc. 3000 Tons $20.40 $61,200.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 3000 Tons $22.53 $67,590.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 3000 Tons $24.00 $72,000.00

2
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Buel Trucking, Inc. 5000 Tons No Bid
R L Tiemann Construction 5000 Tons No Bid
Lyman-Richey Corporation 5000 Tons $19.21 $96,050.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 5000 Tons $22.15 $110,750.00

3
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 5000 Tons No Bid
Buel Trucking, Inc. 5000 Tons $21.55 $107,750.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 5000 Tons $23.44 $117,200.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 5000 Tons $24.42 $122,100.00

4
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 5000 Tons No Bid
Buel Trucking, Inc. 5000 Tons $22.45 $112,250.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 5000 Tons $24.36 $121,800.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 5000 Tons $25.41 $127,050.00

5
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Buel Trucking, Inc. 2000 Tons No Bid
R L Tiemann Construction 2000 Tons $20.30 $40,600.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 2000 Tons $22.34 $44,680.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 2000 Tons $23.91 $47,820.00

6
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 4000 Tons No Bid

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to S. 148th & Hooper Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to Waverly Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to Raymond Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to SW 12th & Saltillo Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to Roca Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to SW 100th & Saltillo Stockpile
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Buel Trucking, Inc. 4000 Tons $22.70 $90,800.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 4000 Tons $25.09 $100,360.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 4000 Tons $26.06 $104,240.00

7
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 2000 Tons No Bid
Buel Trucking, Inc. 2000 Tons $22.15 $44,300.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 2000 Tons $24.36 $48,720.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 2000 Tons $25.41 $50,820.00

8
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Buel Trucking, Inc. 1500 Tons No Bid
Lyman-Richey Corporation 1500 Tons $20.13 $30,195.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 1500 Tons $23.25 $34,875.00
R L Tiemann Construction 1500 Tons $24.15 $36,225.00

9
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction 4000 Tons $21.95 $87,800.00
Lyman-Richey Corporation 4000 Tons $24.36 $97,440.00
Buel Trucking, Inc. 4000 Tons $24.45 $97,800.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 4000 Tons $27.54 $110,160.00

10
Supplier QTY UOM Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes
Lyman-Richey Corporation 3500 Tons $20.68 $72,380.00
Buel Trucking, Inc. 3500 Tons $21.20 $74,200.00
Gana Trucking & Excavating 3500 Tons $23.18 $81,130.00
R L Tiemann Construction 3500 Tons $24.95 $87,325.00

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to S. 134th & “A” Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to Davey Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to SW 100th & Hallam Stockpile

Supplying and Hauling Gravel Surface Course to Emerald Stockpile
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Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note R L Tiemann Construction Buel Trucking, Inc. Lyman-Richey Corporation
1 Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading an Yes Yes Yes
2 Specifications I acknowledge reading an Yes Yes Yes
3 Contact Name of person submittinErich Tiemann James M Buel Pat Tooley
4 Bid Award a) I acknowledge and und a) Yes   b) No a) yes b)no 4a)  Yes     4b)  No

5 Hauling Period 
Acknowledgment I acknowledge and agree 

No, I understand hauling can be 
completed through April 2019 See supplier notes With the bid letting being this 

8 Work Resume Form I have attached my ContraYes Yes Yes

9

Production Facility What is the facility name Alex pit, Alexandria, Nebraska
Central Sand and Gravel 
Bellwood pit #73

Central Sand and Gravel 
Company, Pit #73 - Bellwood, 
4171 F Road, Bellwood, 
Nebraska

10
Weed Inspection and 
Certificate I agree to meet the requirYes, Pit will provide YES Yes

11 Insurance Requirements 
and Endorsements Vendor agrees to provide Yes Yes Yes

13 Purchase Order, 
Contract and Delivery 
Contact

Please list the name, 
email address and phone 
number of the person 
who will be the contact 
person for the PO to be 
awarded.

Erich Tiemann, 
erich@rltiemannconstruction.co
m, 402-520-0295 cell, 402-223-
3294 office

JAMES M BUEL- 
BUELTRUCKING@BUELTR
UCKING.COM 402-781-
2187

Pat Tooley, 
patrick.tooley@centralsand.c
om, 402/750-4397

14
U.S. Citizenship 
Attestation Is your company legally coNo NO No

15 Electronic Signature Please check here for you Yes Yes Yes
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Att #
1
2
3
4

5

8

9

10

11

13

14

15

Gana Trucking & Excavating
Yes
Yes
Tim Lempka
Yes

NO
Yes

Centeral Sand & Gravel 
Bellwood Pit

Yes

Yes

Tim Lempka, 
timl@ganatrucking.com, 402-
430-4853

Yes
Yes
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes
R L Tiemann Construction Erich Tiemann erich@rltiemannconstruction.com

Buel Trucking, Inc. JAMES M BUEL bueltrucking@bueltrucking.com

Most of the gravel being bid will have to be hauled in the spring. The 
gravel producer will need until May 31,2019 to produce the gravel.I 
guarantee I can deliver the Waverly Stockpile this winter if I don't 
have to comply with the Consecutive Days rule if the weather stops 
us.

Lyman-Richey Corporation Patrick Tooley patrick.tooley@centralsand.com

Gana Trucking & Excavating Tim Lempka Timl@ganatrucking.com

Gravel will only be hauled when the weather and conditions allow, ie 
freezing conditions.
Pit production schedule will dictate availability
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1

Sharon R. Mulder

From: Ron L. Bohaty
Sent: Thursday, November 8, 2018 11:00 AM
To: Sharon R. Mulder; Jenifer T. Holloway
Cc: Ashlee S. Wikoff; Christina M. Kling
Subject: Gravel bid 18-269 Addendum 4

AWARD RECOMMENDATION (Multiple Vendors)  
Lancaster County Engineering has reviewed the bid responses for 18-269 Addendum 4 and made the following 
determination:  
Award Line Items [1,3,4,6,7] to Buel Trucking, Inc. for a total of $416,300.00, as they are the lowest responsible, 
responsive Bidder meeting all requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.      
  
Award Line Items 2,8,9,10 to Lyman-Richey Corporation for a total of $286,425,00, as they are the lowest responsible, 
responsive Bidder meeting all requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.      
  
Award Line Item 5 to R L Tiemann Construction for a total of $40,600.00, as they are the lowest responsible, responsive 
Bidder meeting all requirements as outlined in the bid documents and Ebid for these Line Items.      
     
Total Award Amount for All Vendors: $743,325.00 
[Please explain rationale for awarding to multiple vendors and indicate any items that are not being awarded to any 
Vendor]  
 
Award is based off pricing for each location, lowest bid was used for all lines. 
 
Thank You, 
 
 
Ron L Bohaty 
Road Maintenance Superintendent 
Lancaster County Engineering 
402-441-7775 Office 
402-441-6321 Fax 
402-601-9857 Cell 
 
 
 
 


