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Fully Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into
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$394.00

:$549i00
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Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the
Owners price range of $600.00 to $750.00
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Event Number 18-117 Organization Lincoln Purchasing
Event Title Office Seating Workgroup Lincoln Purchasing
Event Description Event Owner Sharon Mulder
Event Type Bid Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
Issue Date 5/2/2018 03:00:01 PM (CT) Phone (402) 441-7428 x
Close Date 5/16/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (402) 441-6513 x

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
All Makes Office Equipment Co. Lincoln NE 5/16/2018 09:26:40 AM (CT) 3 $1,696.00
OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INLINCOLN NE 5/15/2018 02:56:30 PM (CT) 4 $2,063.95
encompas (encompas Corporati Omaha NE 5/16/2018 11:35:27 AM (CT) 5 $3,074.17

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1 Manufacturer and 
Model Warranty

Manufacturer's Price 
List Discount Schedule

Supplier QTY UOM

Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manuf Num

Please provide the 
Manufacturer and 
Model bidding.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
warranty information 
related to each chair 
bidding to the 
Vendor's Response 
Attachment Section of 
the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Manufacturer's Price 
List for our basis of 
pricing to the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Discount Schedule per 
Specifications, Section 
2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to 
the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

All Makes Office Equipment Co. of Linco1 EA No Bid
encompas (encompas Corporation) 1 EA $347.27 $347.27 Haworth Soji Yes Yes Yes

[ALT1] OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, IN 1 EA $362.02 $362.02 SitOnIt Torsa task chair SitOnIt

6023Y/E3A134FG1
C25B14MC5FC11Z3
KD

SitOnIt Torsa 
6023Y/E3A134FGC25B
14MC5FC11Z3KD Yes Yes Yes

OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INC. 1 EA $394.00 $394.00
Teknion Savera 
NSAMH1QP-1EF Yes Yes Yes

2 Manufacturer and 
Model Warranty

Manufacturer's Price 
List Discount Schedule

Supplier QTY UOM

Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manuf Num

Please provide the 
Manufacturer and 
Model bidding.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
warranty information 
related to each chair 
bidding to the 
Vendor's Response 
Attachment Section of 
the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Manufacturer's Price 
List for our basis of 
pricing to the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Discount Schedule per 
Specifications, Section 
2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to 
the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

All Makes Office Equipment Co. of Linco1 EA $408.00 $408.00
No discount schedule specification were located in 
the initial bid request.

Allsteel Lyric CSW-
MHWNO Yes Yes Yes

encompas (encompas Corporation) 1 EA $455.35 $455.35 Haworth Very Yes Yes Yes

OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INC. 1 EA $549.00 $549.00

VIA Proform 172-62c-
1045-18ab-18bb-16hp-
GRA Yes Yes Yes

[ALT1] OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, IN 1 EA $564.00 $564.00 VIA Swopper Chair VIA Swopper 1-SWUS-A-GR2
VIA Swopper 1-SWUS-
A-GR2 Yes Yes Yes

3 Manufacturer and 
Model Warranty

Manufacturer's Price 
List Discount Schedule

Supplier QTY UOM

Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manuf Num

Please provide the 
Manufacturer and 
Model bidding.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
warranty information 
related to each chair 
bidding to the 
Vendor's Response 
Attachment Section of 
the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Manufacturer's Price 
List for our basis of 
pricing to the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

I acknowledge that I 
have attached the 
Discount Schedule per 
Specifications, Section 
2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to 
the Vendor's 
Response Attachment 
Section of the e-bid.

[ALT1] OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, IN 1 EA $539.85 $539.85
SitOnIt Prava Highback fully upholstered task chair 
6423YE3A105VG2C16B8KD TCPN pricing SitOnIt Prava Highba

6423YE3A105VG2C
16B8KD

SITONIT PRAVA 
6423YE3A105VG2C16B
8KD Yes Yes Yes

All Makes Office Equipment Co. of Linco1 EA $548.00 $548.00
No discount schedule specification were located in 
the initial bid request.

Allsteel Mimeo MIW-
KWNO Yes Yes Yes

OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INC. 1 EA $569.00 $569.00

Allseating You 
Highback  84112-4D-
BK-3EB-KD-F-OCDAN Yes Yes Yes

encompas (encompas Corporation) 1 EA $579.48 $579.48 Haworth Zody Yes Yes Yes

4 Manufacturer and 
Model Warranty

Manufacturer's Price 
List Discount Schedule

Fully Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $300.00 to $400.00

Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $400.00 to $500.00

Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $500.00 to $600.00

Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $600.00 to $750.00
18-117 - Page 1



Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email

All Makes Office Equipment Co. of Lincoln Amy Cavadini amyc@allmakes.com

OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INC. Nancy Kraft nancy.kraft@oidinc.com
encompas (encompas Corporation) Marco Lade marco@encompas.com
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Supplier Notes
Discount schedule not acknowledged.  Details were not included in 
the initial bid request.
All seating in this bid the labor to receive assemble and deliver to 
end user $35 each.
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information
Bid Creator Sharon Mulder Asst Address Purchasing Address

Purchasing Agent 440 S. 8th St.
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov Lincoln, NE 68508
Phone (402) 441-7428 x Contact Sharon Mulder Asst Contact
Fax (402) 441-6513 x Purchasing Agent

Department
Bid Number 18-117 Department Building
Title Office Seating Building
Bid Type Bid Suite 200 Floor/Room
Issue Date 5/2/2018 03:00 PM (CT) Floor/Room Telephone
Close Date 5/16/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Telephone (402) 441-7428 x Fax

Fax (402) 441-6513 x Email
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier Information
Company All Makes Office Equipment Co. of Lincoln
Address 3333 O Street

Lincoln, NE 68510
Contact Amy Cavadini
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (402) 473-8324
Fax (402) 473-8330
Email amyc@allmakes.com
Submitted 5/16/2018 09:26:39 AM (CT)
Total $1,696.00

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Signature Amy Cavadini Email amyc@allmakes.com

Supplier Notes
Discount schedule not acknowledged. Details were not included in the initial bid request.

Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages

Bid Attributes
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Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.

2 Specifications I acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes
specifications.

3 Delivery State number of delivery days ARO. FOB to the 21-35 days
City/County at the location specified with all transportation
charges paid.

4 Insurance Requirements and Endorsements Vendor agrees to provide insurance coverage for each Yes
checked box on the Insurance Clause document in the Bid
Attachments including the submission of the Certificate of
ACORD and the applicable endorsements.

Insurance Certificate and required Endorsements are
required at time of contract execution by the vendor.

Vendors are strongly encouraged to send the insurance
requirements and endorsement information to their
insurance agent prior to bid close in order to expedite the
contract execution process.

5 Sample Contract I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample Yes
contract.

6 Purchase Order, Contract and Delivery Contact The City/County Purchasing Department issues Purchase Amy Cavadini
Orders and Contracts via email to a designated contact
person of the awarded Vendor. This designee will be the
primary contact with the department through the delivery
of the product/services.
Please list the name, email address and phone number of
the person who will be the contact person for the PO to be
awarded.

7 Contact Name of person submitting this bid: Amy Cavadini

8 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special Yes
Provision Term Contract Provisions.

9 Renewal is an Option Contract Extension Renewal is an option. Yes

10 Term Clause of Contract I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1) Yes, Yes, 12/31/18
year term with the option for four (4) additional one (1)
year renewals from the date of the executed contract. (a)
Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract
period. YES or NO ________
(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation
YES or NO _______
(c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm:
through ___________

11 Contractor Must Provide References in Bidders Contractor must provide (2) two references for where the YES
Response Section chairs being offered are currently in use.

Each reference must include the following:
Owner:
Street Address:
City: State: Zip:
Name Owners Representative: Phone:
Project Name and/or Number:
Contract Amount:
Completion Date:
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12 Debarred Has your company ever been debarred or suspended for No
doing business with the City of Lincoln/Lancaster
County/PBC of Nebraska

13 U.S. Citizenship Attestation Is your company legally considered an Individual or Sole No
Proprietor: YES or NO

As a Vendor who is legally considered an Individual or a
Sole Proprietor I hereby understand and agree to comply
with the requirements of the United States Citizenship
Attestation Form, available at:
http://www.sos.ne.gov/business/notary/citizenforminfo.html

All awarded Vendors who are legally considered an
Individual or a Sole Proprietor must complete the form and
submit it with contract documents at time of execution.

If a Vendor indicates on such attestation form that he or
she is a qualified alien, the Vendor agrees to provide the
US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation
required to verify the Vendor’s lawful presence in the
United States using the Systematic Alien Verification for
Entitlements (SAVE) Program.

Vendor further understands and agrees that lawful
presence in the United States is required and the Vendor
may be disqualified or the Contract terminated if such
lawful presence cannot be verified as required by Neb.
Rev. Stat. 4-108.

14 Bid Award a) I acknowledge and understand that the City, County Yes, No
and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to
award bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options,
by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or
Public Building Commission. Do you agree and
understand?Yes/No_____

b) Is your pricing based on all-or-nothing basis, please
indicate is so. Yes/No_____

15 Recycling of Corrugated Cardboard I acknowledge that I must comply with the City of Lincoln Yes
recycling regulations which includes a ban of all
corrugated cardboard from the City Landfill effective April
1, 2018. Vendors are encouraged to utilize recycling sites
located throughout the city of Lincoln to dispose of
corrugated cardboard.

16 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 1 EA Fully Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $300.00 to No Bid
$400.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding.

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

2 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $400.00 to $500.00 $408.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes: No discount schedule specification were located in the initial bid request.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Allsteel Lyric CSW-MHWNO

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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3 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $500.00 to $600.00 $548.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes: No discount schedule specification were located in the initial bid request.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Allsteel Mimeo MIW-KWNO

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $600.00 to $750.00 $740.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes: No discount schedule specification were located in the initial bid request.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Allsteel Acuity AWMGGDNO

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: No discount schedule specification were located in the initial bid request. 613.00

Alt Manufacturer: Allsteel Alt Manufacturer #: RL-MHP

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Allsteel Relate RL-MHP

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

5 1 EA Functional Bariatric Office Seating Chairs No Bid

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding.

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Response Total: $1,696.00
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information
Bid Creator Sharon Mulder Asst Address Purchasing Address

Purchasing Agent 440 S. 8th St.
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov Lincoln, NE 68508
Phone (402) 441-7428 x Contact Sharon Mulder Asst Contact
Fax (402) 441-6513 x Purchasing Agent

Department
Bid Number 18-117 Department Building
Title Office Seating Building
Bid Type Bid Suite 200 Floor/Room
Issue Date 5/2/2018 03:00 PM (CT) Floor/Room Telephone
Close Date 5/16/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Telephone (402) 441-7428 x Fax

Fax (402) 441-6513 x Email
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier Information
Company encompas (encompas Corporation)
Address 707 South 15th Street

Omaha, NE 68102
Contact Marco Lade
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (402) 991-7471
Fax (402) 991-7472
Email marco@encompas-ne.com
Submitted 5/16/2018 11:35:26 AM (CT)
Total $3,074.17

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Signature Marco Lade Email marco@encompas.com

Supplier Notes

Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages

Bid Attributes
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Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.

2 Specifications I acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes
specifications.

3 Delivery State number of delivery days ARO. FOB to the 20 Business Days
City/County at the location specified with all transportation
charges paid.

4 Insurance Requirements and Endorsements Vendor agrees to provide insurance coverage for each Yes
checked box on the Insurance Clause document in the Bid
Attachments including the submission of the Certificate of
ACORD and the applicable endorsements.

Insurance Certificate and required Endorsements are
required at time of contract execution by the vendor.

Vendors are strongly encouraged to send the insurance
requirements and endorsement information to their
insurance agent prior to bid close in order to expedite the
contract execution process.

5 Sample Contract I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample Yes
contract.

6 Purchase Order, Contract and Delivery Contact The City/County Purchasing Department issues Purchase Marco Lade,
Orders and Contracts via email to a designated contact marco@encompas.com,
person of the awarded Vendor. This designee will be the 402.991.7471 (office) 402.714.4798
primary contact with the department through the delivery (cell)
of the product/services.
Please list the name, email address and phone number of
the person who will be the contact person for the PO to be
awarded.

7 Contact Name of person submitting this bid: Marco Lade

8 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special Yes
Provision Term Contract Provisions.

9 Renewal is an Option Contract Extension Renewal is an option. Yes

10 Term Clause of Contract I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1) a) yes b) a manufacturer's price
year term with the option for four (4) additional one (1) increase would be passed on to the
year renewals from the date of the executed contract. (a) city after each published
Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract announcement c) pricing submitted
period. YES or NO ________ today is firm through 12/31/2019.
(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation Longer if no price increase is
YES or NO _______ published by Haworth or Via
(c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm:
through ___________

11 Contractor Must Provide References in Bidders Contractor must provide (2) two references for where the YES
Response Section chairs being offered are currently in use.

Each reference must include the following:
Owner:
Street Address:
City: State: Zip:
Name Owners Representative: Phone:
Project Name and/or Number:
Contract Amount:
Completion Date:
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12 Debarred Has your company ever been debarred or suspended for No
doing business with the City of Lincoln/Lancaster
County/PBC of Nebraska

13 U.S. Citizenship Attestation Is your company legally considered an Individual or Sole encompas is an S-Corporation
Proprietor: YES or NO

As a Vendor who is legally considered an Individual or a
Sole Proprietor I hereby understand and agree to comply
with the requirements of the United States Citizenship
Attestation Form, available at:
http://www.sos.ne.gov/business/notary/citizenforminfo.html

All awarded Vendors who are legally considered an
Individual or a Sole Proprietor must complete the form and
submit it with contract documents at time of execution.

If a Vendor indicates on such attestation form that he or
she is a qualified alien, the Vendor agrees to provide the
US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation
required to verify the Vendor’s lawful presence in the
United States using the Systematic Alien Verification for
Entitlements (SAVE) Program.

Vendor further understands and agrees that lawful
presence in the United States is required and the Vendor
may be disqualified or the Contract terminated if such
lawful presence cannot be verified as required by Neb.
Rev. Stat. 4-108.

14 Bid Award a) I acknowledge and understand that the City, County a) Yes b) No
and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to
award bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options,
by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or
Public Building Commission. Do you agree and
understand?Yes/No_____

b) Is your pricing based on all-or-nothing basis, please
indicate is so. Yes/No_____

15 Recycling of Corrugated Cardboard I acknowledge that I must comply with the City of Lincoln Yes
recycling regulations which includes a ban of all
corrugated cardboard from the City Landfill effective April
1, 2018. Vendors are encouraged to utilize recycling sites
located throughout the city of Lincoln to dispose of
corrugated cardboard.

16 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 1 EA Fully Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $300.00 to $347.27
$400.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Soji

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

2 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $400.00 to $500.00 $455.35

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Very

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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3 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $500.00 to $600.00 $579.48

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Zody

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $600.00 to $750.00 $625.23

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Fern

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owner's price range of $600.00 to 645.22
$750.00

Alt Manufacturer: Haworth Alt Manufacturer #: M251-1G43

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Improv H.E.

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

5 1 EA Functional Bariatric Office Seating Chairs $1,066.84

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes: Haworth Improv H.E. XL is rated for 500 lbs. Technically, it is not defined as a 'bariatric' chair.....but instead, a
model suited for 'big & tall' individuals. Our alternate, the Via 4U....is rated to 400 lbs.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Haworth Improv H.E. XL

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: Functional Bariatric Office Seating Chairs 538.47

Alt Manufacturer: Via Alt Manufacturer #: 781-B-LS4B-68C-12SS-38A-XX-17AB-18BB-16HP-01U

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Via 4U

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Response Total: $3,074.17
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information
Bid Creator Sharon Mulder Asst Address Purchasing Address

Purchasing Agent 440 S. 8th St.
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov Lincoln, NE 68508
Phone (402) 441-7428 x Contact Sharon Mulder Asst Contact
Fax (402) 441-6513 x Purchasing Agent

Department
Bid Number 18-117 Department Building
Title Office Seating Building
Bid Type Bid Suite 200 Floor/Room
Issue Date 5/2/2018 03:00 PM (CT) Floor/Room Telephone
Close Date 5/16/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Telephone (402) 441-7428 x Fax

Fax (402) 441-6513 x Email
Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov

Supplier Information
Company OFFICE INTERIORS & DESIGN, INC.
Address 121 CHERRY HILL BLVD.

LINCOLN, NE 68510
Contact Nancy Kraft
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (402) 484-7500
Fax (402) 484-7575
Email NANCY.KRAFT@OIDINC.COM
Submitted 5/15/2018 02:56:28 PM (CT)
Total $2,063.95

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Signature Nancy Kraft Email nancy.kraft@oidinc.com

Supplier Notes
All seating in this bid the labor to receive assemble and deliver to end user $35 each.

Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages

Bid Attributes
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Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.

2 Specifications I acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes
specifications.

3 Delivery State number of delivery days ARO. FOB to the 15-30 days
City/County at the location specified with all transportation
charges paid.

4 Insurance Requirements and Endorsements Vendor agrees to provide insurance coverage for each Yes
checked box on the Insurance Clause document in the Bid
Attachments including the submission of the Certificate of
ACORD and the applicable endorsements.

Insurance Certificate and required Endorsements are
required at time of contract execution by the vendor.

Vendors are strongly encouraged to send the insurance
requirements and endorsement information to their
insurance agent prior to bid close in order to expedite the
contract execution process.

5 Sample Contract I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample Yes
contract.

6 Purchase Order, Contract and Delivery Contact The City/County Purchasing Department issues Purchase Nancy Kraft nancy.kraft@oidinc.com
Orders and Contracts via email to a designated contact 402-484-7500
person of the awarded Vendor. This designee will be the
primary contact with the department through the delivery
of the product/services.
Please list the name, email address and phone number of
the person who will be the contact person for the PO to be
awarded.

7 Contact Name of person submitting this bid: Nancy Kraft

8 Special Provision Term Contract Provisions I acknowledge reading and understanding the Special Yes
Provision Term Contract Provisions.

9 Renewal is an Option Contract Extension Renewal is an option. Yes

10 Term Clause of Contract I acknowledge that the term of the contract is for a one (1) A. yes B. yes after one year C. one
year term with the option for four (4) additional one (1) year
year renewals from the date of the executed contract. (a)
Are your bid prices firm for the first one (1) year contract
period. YES or NO ________
(b) Are your bid prices subject to escallation/de-escalation
YES or NO _______
(c) If (b), state period for which prices will remain firm:
through ___________

11 Contractor Must Provide References in Bidders Contractor must provide (2) two references for where the YES
Response Section chairs being offered are currently in use.

Each reference must include the following:
Owner:
Street Address:
City: State: Zip:
Name Owners Representative: Phone:
Project Name and/or Number:
Contract Amount:
Completion Date:
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12 Debarred Has your company ever been debarred or suspended for no
doing business with the City of Lincoln/Lancaster
County/PBC of Nebraska

13 U.S. Citizenship Attestation Is your company legally considered an Individual or Sole no
Proprietor: YES or NO

As a Vendor who is legally considered an Individual or a
Sole Proprietor I hereby understand and agree to comply
with the requirements of the United States Citizenship
Attestation Form, available at:
http://www.sos.ne.gov/business/notary/citizenforminfo.html

All awarded Vendors who are legally considered an
Individual or a Sole Proprietor must complete the form and
submit it with contract documents at time of execution.

If a Vendor indicates on such attestation form that he or
she is a qualified alien, the Vendor agrees to provide the
US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation
required to verify the Vendor’s lawful presence in the
United States using the Systematic Alien Verification for
Entitlements (SAVE) Program.

Vendor further understands and agrees that lawful
presence in the United States is required and the Vendor
may be disqualified or the Contract terminated if such
lawful presence cannot be verified as required by Neb.
Rev. Stat. 4-108.

14 Bid Award a) I acknowledge and understand that the City, County yes
and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to
award bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options,
by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or
Public Building Commission. Do you agree and
understand?Yes/No_____

b) Is your pricing based on all-or-nothing basis, please
indicate is so. Yes/No_____

15 Recycling of Corrugated Cardboard I acknowledge that I must comply with the City of Lincoln Yes
recycling regulations which includes a ban of all
corrugated cardboard from the City Landfill effective April
1, 2018. Vendors are encouraged to utilize recycling sites
located throughout the city of Lincoln to dispose of
corrugated cardboard.

16 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 1 EA Fully Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $300.00 to $394.00
$400.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Teknion Savera NSAMH1QP-1EF

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: SitOnIt Torsa task chair 362.02

Alt Manufacturer: SitOnIt Alt Manufacturer #: 6023Y/E3A134FG1C25B14MC5FC11Z3KD

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. SitOnIt Torsa
6023Y/E3A134FGC25B14MC5FC11Z3KD

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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2 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $400.00 to $500.00 $549.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. VIA Proform
172-62c-1045-18ab-18bb-16hp-GRA

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: VIA Swopper Chair 564.00

Alt Manufacturer: VIA Swopper Alt Manufacturer #: 1-SWUS-A-GR2

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. VIA Swopper 1-SWUS-A-GR2

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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3 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $500.00 to $600.00 $569.00

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Allseating You Highback
84112-4D-BK-3EB-KD-F-OCDAN

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: SitOnIt Prava Highback fully upholstered task chair 6423YE3A105VG2C16B8KD 539.85
TCPN pricing

Alt Manufacturer: SitOnIt Prava Highback task chair Alt Manufacturer #: 6423YE3A105VG2C16B8KD

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. SITONIT PRAVA
6423YE3A105VG2C16B8KD

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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4 1 EA Functional Office Seating Chairs that fall into the Owners price range of $600.00 to $750.00 No Bid

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding.

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

5 1 EA Functional Bariatric Office Seating Chairs $551.95

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. Teknion Savera XL
NSAXF1GPF0102M145S1E TCPN
Pricing

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.
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Alt 1 1 EA Alt Spec: VIA 4U BARIATRIC 488.00

Alt Manufacturer: VIA Alt Manufacturer #: 781-68C-B-38A1-17AB-18BB-16HP-O1U-GRA

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. VIA 4U BARI
781-68C-B38A1-17AB-18BB-16HP-O1U-GRA

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Alt 2 1 EA Alt Spec: RFM EVOLVE BT BARI CHAIR TO 400LBS. 447.00

Alt Manufacturer: RFM Seating Alt Manufacturer #: BT-16-2024-12A-GRD2

Item Notes: A minimum of two (2) chairs will be selected for this category with the Owner's determining if additional chairs will
be added. If you wish to bid more chairs, you can click in the bid line; "add alternate" to add additional chairs.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Manufacturer and Model Please provide the Manufacturer and Model bidding. RFM Seating Evolve BT
BT-16-2024-12A-GRD2

2 Warranty I acknowledge that I have attached the warranty Yes
information related to each chair bidding to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

3 Manufacturer's Price List I acknowledge that I have attached the Manufacturer's Yes
Price List for our basis of pricing to the Vendor's
Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

4 Discount Schedule I acknowledge that I have attached the Discount Schedule Yes
per Specifications, Section 2, 2.2.4 and 2.2.4.1 to the
Vendor's Response Attachment Section of the e-bid.

Response Total: $2,063.95




