
Event Number 18-016 Organization Lincoln Purchasing
Event Title Tactical Gear for Lancaster County Sheriff DWorkgroup Lincoln Purchasing
Event Description Event Owner Sharon Mulder
Event Type Bid Email smulder@lincoln.ne.gov
Issue Date 1/19/2018 02:00:00 PM (CT) Phone (402) 441-7428
Close Date 2/2/2018 12:00:00 PM (CT) Fax (402) 441-6513

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
Dive Rescue International, Inc Fort Collins CO 1/19/2018 03:19:36 PM (CT) 0 $0.00
GT Distributors, Inc. Austin TX 2/2/2018 08:12:33 AM (CT) 13 $24,122.14
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUTO 
RADIO CO INC) ST LOUIS MO 2/2/2018 10:21:32 AM (CT) 13 $25,642.00

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification.  No alternate response data is included.
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1
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 10 EA No Bid Protech SBA-MR01-3A-M
GT Distributors, Inc. 10 EA $715.29 $7,152.90 Protech SBA-MR01-3A-M PROTECH-SBA-MR01-3A-M

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR 
AUTO RADIO CO INC) 10 EA $760.00 $7,600.00

Tactical Array part for this bid  PTA-FAV-
AWS-MR02-3A  Matrix 3A ballistic panel 
array Protech SBA-MR01-3A-M

Safariland Protech  PTA-FAV-AWS-
MR02-3A

2
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-FAV-AWS-MR
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $399.83 $799.66 Protech PTA-FAV-AWS-MR PROTECH-PTA-FAV-AWS-MR3A

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $425.00 $850.00
FAV Carrier part for this bid PTA-FAV-AWS-
VCS  FAV AWS VCS Platform Tactical Green Protech PTA-FAV-AWS-MR

Safariland  Protech   PTA-FAV-
AWS-VCS

3
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 10 EA No Bid Protech PTA-2113-10X12-M

GT Distributors, Inc. 10 EA $352.94 $3,529.40 Protech PTA-2113-10X12-MPROTECH-PTA-2113-10X12-MC-SH
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT10 EA $375.00 $3,750.00 Protech PTA-2113-10X12-MSafariland Protech   1011419

4
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 12 EA No Bid Protech PTA-DELTA5-HC-TW

Monarch Level IIIA, A7 Body Armor Panels

Monarch Level IIIA, FAV with Advanced Webless System

10x12 Multi-Curve, Shooters Cut - Stand Alone Armor Plate, 2113MC-3 Type III

Delta 5 High-Cut Tactical Helmet with Team Wendy Suspension
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GT Distributors, Inc. 12 EA $889.41 $10,672.92 Protech PTA-DELTA5-HC-TWPROTECH-PTA-DELTA5-HC-TW

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT12 EA $945.00 $11,340.00 Protech PTA-DELTA5-HC-TW
Safariland Protech  PTA-D5-HC-
TW

5
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 10 EA No Bid Protech PTA-RAIL-SET-BNG

GT Distributors, Inc. 10 EA $88.24 $882.40 Protech PTA-RAIL-SET-BNGPROTECH PTA-RAIL-SET-BNG-GRN
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT10 EA $94.00 $940.00 Protech PTA-RAIL-SET-BNGSafariland Protech   1177283

6
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 10 EA No Bid Protech PTA-VAS-SHROUD-

GT Distributors, Inc. 10 EA $70.59 $705.90 Protech PTA-VAS-SHROUD-
PROTECH PTA-VAS-SHROUD-
TRIPLE-GRN

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT10 EA $75.00 $750.00 Protech PTA-VAS-SHROUD-Safariland Protech  1190915

7
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP10B
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP10B PROTECH PTA-LT-TP10B

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00

One of six pouches in SIX POUCH KIT, total 
price of kit $198.00  price per pouch 
becomes $33, but kit allows purchaser to 
choose pouches regardless of individual 
price. Other five pouches picked in SIX 
POUCH KIT follow below. Protech PTA-LT-TP10B Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-6SET

Rail Set with Bungees

NVG Shroud, Triple Hole

Sider Arm Magazine Pouch, Triple
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8
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP14A
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP14A PROTECH PTA-LT-TP14A
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00 Protech PTA-LT-TP14A Safariland Protech  PTA-LT-6SET

9
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP17A
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP17A PROTECH PTA-LT-TP17A
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00 Protech PTA-LT-TP17A Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-6SET

10
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP19
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP19 PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP19
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00 Protech PTA-LT-TP19 Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-6SET

11
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP20
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP20 PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP20
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00 Protech PTA-LT-TP20 Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-6SET

12
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Medical Pouch

Universal Radio Pouch with Bungee

Expandable Baton / Flashlight Pouch, Combo

Handcuff Pouch, Double

Utility Pouch, 8 x 8
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Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-LT-TP21A
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $30.59 $61.18 Protech PTA-LT-TP21A PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP21A
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $33.00 $66.00 Protech PTA-LT-TP21A Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-6SET

13
Manufacturer and Model/Item 
Number

Supplier QTY UOM
Unit Price Extended

Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manuf Num
Please provide Manufacturer and 
Model/Item Number bidding.

Dive Rescue International, Inc 2 EA No Bid Protech PTA-IDP-SHE-LG
GT Distributors, Inc. 2 EA $5.94 $11.88 Protech PTA-IDP-SHE-LG PROTECH - PTA-IDP-SHE-LG

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (ED ROEHR AUT2 EA $8.00 $16.00

Will usually have large ID back, smaller ID 
in front, regardless same price, just 
different part however you choose Protech PTA-IDP-SHE-LG

Safariland  Protech     I-SHE-LG    
large ID   or   I-SHE-SM   small ID

ID Patch, 8.5" x 3", Large "SHERIFF"
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Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note Dive Rescue International, Inc GT Distributors, Inc.

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS 
(ED ROEHR AUTO RADIO CO 
INC)

1
Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading an Yes Yes Yes

2
Purchase Order, Contract The City/County Purchasin

LMeininger@DiveRescueIntl.co
m    800-248-3483

ACCOUNT MANAGER, 1-800-
252-8310, 

frank@edroehrsafety.com   816-
215-7581

3

Specifications I acknowledge reading an Yes Yes Yes

4
Delivery State number of delivery 0 90-120 60

5 Bid Documents I acknowledge and acceptYes Yes Yes
6 Contact Name of person submittinLinda Meininger DAVID CURTIS Frank Hoback
7 U.S. Citizenship AttestatioIs your company legally coNo NO No
8 Debarred Has your company ever b No NO No
9 Electronic Signature Please check here for you Yes Yes Yes

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH-SBA-MR01-3A-M
Safariland Protech  PTA-FAV-
AWS-MR02-3A

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu
PROTECH-PTA-FAV-AWS-
MR3A

Safariland  Protech   PTA-FAV-
AWS-VCS

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu
PROTECH-PTA-2113-10X12-
MC-SH Safariland Protech   1011419

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu
PROTECH-PTA-DELTA5-HC-
TW

Safariland Protech  PTA-D5-HC-
TW

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu
PROTECH PTA-RAIL-SET-
BNG-GRN Safariland Protech   1177283

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu
PROTECH PTA-VAS-SHROUD-
TRIPLE-GRN Safariland Protech  1190915

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH PTA-LT-TP10B
Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-
6SET

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH PTA-LT-TP14A Safariland Protech  PTA-LT-6SET

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH PTA-LT-TP17A
Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-
6SET
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Att # Attribute Name Attribute Note Dive Rescue International, Inc GT Distributors, Inc.

ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS 
(ED ROEHR AUTO RADIO CO 
INC)

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP19
Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-
6SET

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP20
Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-
6SET

1 Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH - PTA-LT-TP21A
Safariland Protech   PTA-LT-
6SET

1
Manufacturer and Model/Please provide Manufactu PROTECH - PTA-IDP-SHE-LG

Safariland  Protech     I-SHE-LG    
large ID   or   I-SHE-SM   small ID
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Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

Dive Rescue International, Inc Linda Meininger LMeininger@DiveRescueIntl.com

We have No Bid this as we do not carry the items requested. Thank 
you.
Linda Meininger

GT Distributors, Inc. DAVID CURTIS TXBIDS@GTDIST.COM
ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS (EFrank John Hoback frank@edroehrsafety.com
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