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CITY OF LINCOLN/LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA 

CONTRACT TERMS 
 
  
 
 THIS CONTRACT, made and entered into by and between Crop Production Services, Inc, 
5320 Airport Road, Spearfish, SD 57783, hereinafter called “Contractor”, and the City of Lincoln, 
Nebraska, a municipal corporation, and the County of Lancaster, Nebraska, a political subdivision of 
the State of Nebraska, hereinafter called the “Owners”. 
 
 WHEREAS, the Owner has caused to be prepared, in accordance with law, Specifications, 
Plans, and other Contract Documents for the Work herein described, and has approved and adopted 
said documents and has caused to be published an advertisement for and in connection with said 
Work, to-wit:        
  

 Turf Fertilizer and Chemicals, Bid No. 17-319 
and, 
 
 WHEREAS, the Contractor, in response to such advertisement, has submitted to the Owners, in 
the manner and at the time specified, a sealed Proposal/Supplier Response in accordance with the 
terms of said advertisement; and, 
 
 WHEREAS, the Owners, in the manner prescribed by law has publicly opened, read aloud, 
examined, and canvassed the Proposals/Supplier Responses submitted in response to such 
advertisement, and as a result of such canvass has determined and declared the Contractor to be the 
lowest responsible bidder for the said Work for the sum or sums named in the Contractor's 
Proposal/Supplier Responses, a copy thereof being attached to and made a part of this Contract; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the sums to be paid to the Contractor and the mutual 
covenants herein contained, the Contractor and the Owners have agreed and hereby agree as follows: 
 
1. The Contractor agrees to (a) furnish all tools, equipment, supplies, superintendence, 

transportation, and other accessories, services, and facilities; (b) furnish all materials, supplies, 
and equipment specified to be incorporated into and form a permanent part of the complete 
work; (c) provide and perform all necessary labor in a substantial and workmanlike manner and 
in accordance with the provisions of the Contract Documents; and (d) execute and complete all 
Work included in and covered by the Owners’ award of this Contract to the Contractor, such 
award being based on the acceptance by the Owner of the Contractor's Proposal, or part 
thereof, as follows: 

 
Agreement to Line Items 10, 52 & 53, 56, 58 and 60 & 61 of Contractor’s Proposal 

 
2. The Owners agree to pay to the Contractor for the performance of the Work embraced in this 

Contract, the Contractor agrees to accept as full compensation therefore, the following sums 
and prices for all Work covered by and included in the Contract award and designated above, 
payment thereof to be made in the manner provided by the Owners:    

 
The Owners will pay for products/service, according to the Line Item pricing as listed in 
Contractors Proposal/Supplier Response, a copy thereof being attached to and made a 
part of this Contract. The Owners shall order on an as- needed basis for the duration of 
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the contract. The cost of products or services for County agencies shall not 
exceed $9,632.40 during the contract term without approval by the Board of 
Commissioners. The cost of products or services for City Departments shall not 
exceed $1,077.00 during the contract term without approval.   

 
3. Equal Employment Opportunity.  In connection with the carrying out of this project, the 

contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of 
race, color, religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, disability, age or marital status.  The 
Contractor will take affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed, and that 
employees are treated during employment, without regard to their race, color, religion, sex, 
national origin, ancestry, disability, age or marital status.  Such action shall include, but not be 
limited to, the following:  employment, upgrading, demotion or transfer; recruitment or 
recruitment advertising; layoff or termination; rates of pay or other compensation; and selection 
for training, including apprenticeship.  

 
4. E-Verify.  In accordance with Neb. Rev. Stat. 4-108 through 4-114, the contractor agrees to 

register with and use a federal immigration verification system, to determine the work eligibility 
status of new employees performing services within the state of Nebraska.  A federal 
immigration verification system means the electronic verification of the work authorization 
program of the Illegal Immigration Reform and Immigrant Responsibility Act of 1996, 8 U.S.C. 
1324 a, otherwise known as the E-Verify Program, or an equivalent federal program designated 
by the United States Department of Homeland Security or other federal agency authorized to 
verify the work eligibility status of a newly hired employee pursuant to the Immigration Reform 
and Control Act of 1986.  The Contractor shall not discriminate against any employee or 
applicant for employment to be employed in the performance of this section pursuant to the 
requirements of state law and 8 U.S.C.A 1324b.  The contractor shall require any subcontractor 
to comply with the provisions of this section. 

 
5.  Termination.  This Contract may be terminated by the following: 
 5.1) Termination for Convenience.  Either party may terminate this Contract upon thirty (30) 

days written notice to the other party for any reason without penalty. 
 5.2) Termination for Cause.  The Owners may terminate the Contract for cause if the 

Contractor: 
  5.2.1) Refuses or fails to supply the proper labor, materials and equipment necessary to 

provide services and/or commodities. 
  5.2.2) Disregards Federal, State or local laws, ordinances, regulations, resolutions or 

orders. 
5.2.3) Otherwise commits a substantial breach or default of any provision of the 

Contract Document.  In the event of a substantial breach or default the Owners 
will provide the Contractor written notice of said breach or default and allow the 
Contractor ten (10) days from the date of the written notice to cure such breach 
or default.  If said breach or default is not cured within ten (10) days from the 
date of notice, then the contract shall terminate.  

 
6.  Independent Contractor.  It is the express intent of the parties that this contract shall not create 

an employer-employee relationship.  Employees of the Contractor shall not be deemed to be 
employees of the Owners and employees of the Owners shall not be deemed to be employees 
of the Contractor.  The Contractor and the Owners shall be responsible to their respective 
employees for all salary and benefits.  Neither the Contractor’s employees nor the Owners’ 
employees shall be entitled to any salary, wages, or benefits from the other party, including but 
not limited to overtime, vacation, retirement benefits, workers’ compensation, sick leave or injury 
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leave.  Contractor shall also be responsible for maintaining workers’ compensation insurance, 
unemployment insurance for its employees, and for payment of all federal, state, local and any 
other payroll taxes with respect to its employees’ compensation. 

 
7. Owner Inclusion. It is understood and agreed by all parties that “Owner/s” shall include the City 

of Lincoln and Lancaster County, Nebraska.  Whenever in the Contract documents, including 
the instructions to bidders, specifications, insurance requirements, bonds, and terms and 
conditions or any other documents which are a part of the Contract, a singular entity is 
referenced (i.e., “the City” or “the County”) it shall mean the “Owners” encompassing the City of 
Lincoln, and Lancaster County. Notwithstanding the foregoing, the duties and obligations of the 
City and the County pursuant to the Contract shall be treated as divisible and severable duties 
and obligations, and default by any one of the City and the County shall not be attributed to any 
other of the Owners, but shall remain the sole obligation of the defaulting entity. 

 
8. Period of Performance.  This Contract shall be effective March 6, 2018 through March 7, 2019.  

The term of the Contract shall be a one (1) year term.  
 
9. The Contract Documents comprise the Contract, and consist of the following: 
 1.   Contract Terms 
 2.   Accepted Proposal/Supplier Response 
 3.   Addendums 1 and 2 
 4.   Special Provisions 
 5.   Specifications 
   6.   Instructions to Bidders 
 7.   Proprietary Information for Bids/Quotes/RFP’s 
 8.   Sales Tax Exemption Form 13 
                 (Note: This form cannot be used for the WATER Division of the City of Lincoln.  The WATER  
       Division is taxable per Reg. 066.14A or applicable laws.) 
 9.   Notice to Bidders 

   
The herein above mentioned Contract Documents form this Contract and are a part of the 

Contract as if hereto attached.  Said documents which are not attached to this document may be 
viewed at: lincoln.ne.gov - Keyword: Bid - Awarded or Closed bids. 

 
 The Contractor and the Owners hereby agree that all the terms and conditions of this Contract 
shall be binding upon themselves, and their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal 
representatives, successors, and assigns. 
 
 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Contractor and the Owners do hereby execute this contract upon 
completion of signatures on: 
 
 Vendor Signature Page 

City of Lincoln Signature Page 
Lancaster County Signature Page  
 

 



mavandee
Typewritten Text
52530 Airport Road   Spearfish, SD 57783

mavandee
Typewritten Text
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City of Lincoln Signature Page 
 
 

_______________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

CONTRACT 
Annual Supply  

Turf Fertilizer and Chemicals 
Bid No. 17-319 

City of Lincoln and Lancaster County 
Crop Production Services, Inc 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

EXECUTION BY THE CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 
 
 
 

 
ATTEST:       
 
 
___________________________________ 
City Clerk 

CITY OF LINCOLN, NEBRASKA 
 
 
__________________________________________ 
Chris Beutler, Mayor 
 
 
Approved by Executive Order No._______________  
 
 
dated _____________________________________ 
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Lancaster County Signature Page 
 
 

________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
 

CONTRACT 
Annual Supply  

Turf Fertilizer and Chemicals 
Bid No. 17-319 

City of Lincoln and Lancaster County 
Crop Production Services, Inc 

 
 
 
 

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 

The Board of County Commissioners of 
Lancaster, Nebraska 

 

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

______________________________________

dated _________________________________ 

 

Contract Approved as to Form: 
 
 
______________________________________ 
Deputy Lancaster County Attorney 

ccvksl
Typewritten Text
C-18-0045
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City of Lincoln/Lancaster County (Lincoln Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information

Bid Creator Rachelle Hinze, Buyer Address Purchasing Address
Email rhinze@lincoln.ne.gov 440 S. 8th St.
Phone 1 (402) 441-8313 Lincoln, NE 68508
Fax 1 (402) 441-6513 Contact Rachelle Hinze, Buyer Contact

Bid Number 17-319 Addendum 2 Department Department
Title Annual Supply Turf Fertilizer Building Building

and Chemicals Suite 200
Bid Type Bid Floor/Room Floor/Room
Issue Date 12/5/2017 01:43 PM (CT) Telephone 1 (402) 441-8313 Telephone
Close Date 12/20/2017 12:00:00 PM (CT) Fax 1 (402) 441-6513 Fax

Email rhinze@lincoln.ne.gov Email

Supplier Information

Company Crop Production Services, Inc
Address 5320 Airport Road

Spearfish, SD 57783
Contact Bill Walker
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (605) 642-3800
Fax (605) 642-3784
Email william.walker@cpsagu.com
Submitted 12/19/2017 08:43:21 PM (CT)
Total $28,713.20

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Signature William Walker Email william.walker@cpsagu.com

Supplier Notes

All terms are net 30 days from invoice date
All product pricing is delivered pricing
Products can be purchased in partial case lots if needed

Bid Notes

Bid Activities

Bid Messages
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Bid Attributes
Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 U.S. Citizenship Attestation Is your company legally considered an Individual or Sole No
Proprietor: YES or NO

As a Vendor who is legally considered an Individual or a
Sole Proprietor I hereby understand and agree to comply
with the requirements of the United States Citizenship
Attestation Form, available at:
http://www.sos.ne.gov/business/notary/citizenforminfo.html

All awarded Vendors who are legally considered an
Individual or a Sole Proprietor must complete the form and
submit it with contract documents at time of execution.

If a Vendor indicates on such attestation form that he or
she is a qualified alien, the Vendor agrees to provide the
US Citizenship and Immigration Services documentation
required to verify the Vendor’s lawful presence in the
United States using the Systematic Alien Verification for
Entitlements (SAVE) Program.

Vendor further understands and agrees that lawful
presence in the United States is required and the Vendor
may be disqualified or the Contract terminated if such
lawful presence cannot be verified as required by Neb.
Rev. Stat. 4-108.

2 Bid Documents I acknowledge and accept that it is my responsibility as a Yes
Bidder to promptly notify the Purchasing Department Staff
prior to the close of the bid of any ambiguity, inconsistency
or error which I may discover upon examination of the bid
documents including, but not limited to the Specifications.

3 Instructions to Bidders I acknowledge reading and understanding the Instructions Yes
to Bidders.

4 Specifications I acknowledge reading and understanding the Yes
specifications.

5 Alternate Products I acknowledge if bidding an alternate product I have Yes
attached information on the alternate product in the
suppliers response section.

6 Quantities I acknowledge that the quantity listed for each line item Y
are an estimated yearly amount. The City does not
guarantee any dollar amount or order quantities for the
term of the contract.

7 Bid award a) I acknowledge and understand that the City, County Yes
and/or Public Building Commission reserves the right to
award bids item-by-item, with or without alternates/options,
by groups, or "lump sum" such as shall best serve the
requirements and interests of the City, County and/or
Public Building Commission. Do you agree and
understand? Yes/No _____

b) Is your pricing based on an all-or-nothing basis, please
indicate if so. ________

8 Sample Contract I acknowledge reading and understanding the sample Yes
contract.
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9 Purchase Order, Contract and Delivery Contact The City/County Purchasing Department issues Purchase William "Bill" Walker -
Orders and Contracts via email to a designated contact william.walker@cpsagu.com -
person of the awarded Vendor. This designee will be the 1-605-645-1636 mobile/cell -
primary contact with the department through the delivery 1-866-642-3800 toll free office
of the product/services.
Please list the name, email address and phone number of
the person who will be the contact person for the PO to be
awarded.

10 Delivery State number of delivery days ARO. FOB to the 4 to 5 days from reciept of orders
City/County at the location specified with all transportation
charges paid.

11 Contact Name of person submitting this bid: William Walker

12 Electronic Signature Please check here for your electronic signature. Yes

13 Agreement to Addendum No. 1 Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in Yes
this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal and
is part of their bid. Reason: See Bid Attachments section
for Addendum information.

14 Agreement to Addendum No. 2 Respondent hereby certifies that the change set forth in Yes
this addendum has been incorporated in their proposal and
is part of their bid. Reason: See Bid Attachments section
for Addendum information.
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 95 Gallons Quali Pro 3-D Herbicide Active Ingredients: 2, 4-D - 30.56%, Dicamba - 2.77%, Mecoprop-p No Bid
- 8.17%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product.

2 13 Gallons Quali Pro T Nex 1 AQ Growth Regulator Active Ingredient; Trinexapac-ethyl - 11.3% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product.

3 12 Gallons QualiPro Pac-Low (Turf Enhancer) Growth Regulator No Bid
Active Ingredient; Paclobutrozol - 22.3%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

4 55 Gallons Quali Pro Ethephon 2 SL Growth Regulator Active Ingredient; Ethepon - 21.7% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

5 96 Ounces QuickSilver Herbicide Active Ingredient; Carfentrazone-ethyl - 21.3% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per ounce. Preferred size is 8 oz. bottle

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

6 1,560 Ounces Dimension Ultra 40WP NO SUBSTITUTES WILL BE ACCEPTED Active Ingredient; No Bid
Dithiopyr - 40%

Item Notes: Unit price is per ounce. Preferred size is 8 x 5 ounces

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

7 120 Pounds QualiPro Prodiamine 65 WDG Herbicide Active Ingredient; Prodiamine - 65% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound. Preferred size is 5lb

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

8 130 Gallons Speedzone Herbicide Active Ingredients; 2, 4-D - 28.57%, Dicamba - 1.71%, Mecoprop-p $67.60
acid - 5.88%, Carfentrazone-ethyl - .62%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand Product bid is: Speedzone
Herbicide- Manufactured by - PBI
Gordon, Inc - Package size
available is 2.5 gallon containers -
EPA Reg # 2217-833

9 120 Gallons Ranger Pro Herbicide Active Ingredients; Glyphosate - 41% Other, including surfactant 59% $12.88

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Mad Dog Plus
Herbicide - Manufactured by -
Loveland Products - Package size
available is 2.5 gallon containers -
EPA Reg # 34704-890
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10 85 Pounds Alligare Mojave 70 EG Herbicide Active Ingredients: Diuron - 62.22%, Imazapry - 7.78% $7.60

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound. Preferred size is 5 lb. Bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Imazuron Herbicide -
Manufactured by - NuFarm -
package size available is 10 pound
bags only - EPA Reg #228-654

11 15 Gallon Cutless MEC Growth Regulator NO SUBSTITUTES Active Ingredient: Fluprimidol, 16% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

12 192 Ounces Defendor Herbicide by Dow Active Ingredient: Florasulam, 4.8% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per ounce. Preferred size is 32 oz.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

13 15 Gallons Secure Fungicide Active Ingredient; Fluazinam - 40% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

14 836 Ounces Velista Fungicide Active Ingredient: Penthiopyrad, 50% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per ounce. Preferred size is 22 oz.

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product you are
bidding.

15 40 Gallon Daconil Weatherstik Fungicide No Bid
NO SUBSTITUTES
Active ingredient: Chlorothalonil, 54%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product

16 10 Gallons Quali-Pro Propiconazole 14.3 Fungicide Active Ingredient; Propiconazole - 14.3% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

17 10 Gallons Tartan Fungicide with Stressgard Active ingredients: Trifloxystrobin, 4.17% Triadimefon, No Bid
20.86%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Pacage Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

18 72 Pounds Honor Intrinsic Fungicide Active Ingredients; Pyraclostrobin - 16.8%, Boscalid - 11.2% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound. Preferred size is 36lb.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product
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19 12 Gallons QualiPro Tebucaonzole 3.6F Fungicide Active Ingredient: Tebuconazole - 38.70% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

20 8 Gallon Tide Propiconazole 41.8 No Bid
Active ingredient: Propiconazole, 41%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product

21 50 Gallons Daconil Action Fungicide NO SUBSTITUTES WILL BE ACCEPTED Active Ingredient; No Bid
Chlorothalonil - 53.94%, Acibenzolar-S-methyl - .11%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

22 12 Pounds Heritage Action Fungicide NO SUBSTITUTES WILL BE ACCEPTED Active Ingredient; No Bid
Azoxystrobin - 50%, Acibenzolar-S-Methyl, 1.18%

Item Notes: Unit price is per Pounds. Preferred size is 1 Pound

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Pacage Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

23 12 Gallons Quali-Pro Mefenoxam (Subdue) 2AQ Fungicide Active Ingredient; Mefenoxam - 22.5% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

24 6 Gallons Pro Plant Fungicide (Banol) Active Ingredient; Propamocarb Hydrochloride - 66.5% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

25 20 Gallons Trinity Fungicide Active Ingredient; Triticonazole - 19.2% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Pacakge Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

26 196 Ounce Segway Fungicide Active Ingredient: Cyazifamid 34,5% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per Ounce.
Preferred size is 39.2 oz bottle.

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List your package sizes and brand of product

27 15 Gallon Chipco 26 GT Flo Fungicide NO SUBSTITUTES Active Ingredient Iprodione, 23.3% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the package sizes and brand of products

28 10 Lb. Quali-Pro Strobe 50 WG Fungicide Active Ingredient: Azoxystrobin 5% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound.
Preferred size is 1 pound container
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Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the packages sizes and brand of product

29 132 Lb. Quali-Pro Fosetyl-AI 80 Fungicide Active Ingredient: Aluminum Tris Phosphonates, 80% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound.
Preferred size is 5.5lb. container

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

30 30 Gallon Quali-Pro Chlorothalonil 720 SFT Fungicide Active Ingredient: Chlorothalonil, 54% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred size is 2.5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the package size and brand of product

31 2 Gallon Briskway Fungicide Active Ingredients; Azoxystrobin, 18.2% Diffenconazole, 11.4% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred packages size: 1 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the package size and brand of product

32 2 Gallons Acelepryn Insecticide Active Ingredient; Chlorantraniliprole - 18.4% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is .5 Gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product
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33 600 Pounds Dylox 6.2G Insecticide Active Ingredient; Trichlorfon, dimethyl, 6.2% No Bid

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound. Preferred size is 30lb bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

34 380 50 lb. bag UFLEXX 46-0-0 Fertilizer NO SUBSTITUTES Analysis: Urea Nitrogen stablized with $20.45
Hydrexx; SGN: 210

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product you are Product bid is: UFLEXX 46-0-0
bidding. Granule Fertilizer - Manufactured by

- KOCH - Packaged in 50 lb. bags

35 35 50 lb. bag Polyon 0-0-45 Mini Fertilizer NO SUBSTITUTES WILL BE ACCEPTED Analysis: 100% No Bid
Polymer Coated Sulfate of Potash

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

36 60 40 lb. bag Andersons 18-9-18 Contec DG fertilizer with Fe & Mn Product #CDG181WM4 Analysis: No Bid
60% Mutech, potassium sulfate SGN:75 NO SUBSTITUTES WILL BE ACCEPTED

Item Notes: Unit price is per 40 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

37 60 40 lb. bag County Club MD Greensgrade 18-3-18 fertilizer NO SUBSTITUTES Product #2129074 No Bid
Analysis: 78% Meth-Ex, SOP, Micros SGN: 80

Item Notes: Unit price is per 40 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:



17-319 Addendum 2 - Crop Production Services, Inc - Page 12 of 19

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

38 90 40 lb. bag Country Club MD greensgrade 12-0-24 fertilizer Product #: 2135736 NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid
Analysis: 65% Meth-Ex, SOP, Micros SGN: 80

Item Notes: Unit price is per 40 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

39 75 50 lb. bag Andersons 27-3-11 Fertilizer No Bid
Product #: AGC83011.1
NO SUBSTITUTES
Analysis: 48% extend, 48% Poly-S nitrogen potassium chloride
SGN: 240

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List your package sizes and brand of product

40 60 50 lb. bag Turf King 18-24-12 Starter Fertilizer No Bid
Analysis: 50% XCU, SOP
SGN: 220

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

41 300 50 lb. bag Turf King 21-0-10 Fertilizer w/ 3%Fe, and organics No Bid
Analysis: 50% of nitrogen from UFLEXX, potassium
chloride, activated sewage, iron oxysulfate

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product
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42 460 50 lb. bag Lebanon Proscapes 25-0-5 Fertilizer No Bid
Product #: 2254318
NO SUBSTITUTES
Analysis: 51% MESA, 1% Fe, SOP

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

43 500 50 lb. bag Andersons 18-3-12 fertilizer w/ .164 Dimension No Bid
Product #: APT18DM5.3
NO SUBSTITUTES
Active ingredient: Dithiopyr, .164%
Analysis: Minimum 25% pcscu
SGN: 150 maximum

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

44 210 50 lb. bag EC Grow 24-0-5 w/ .43% Barricade, 40% RXN nitrogen No Bid
Active ingredient: Prodiamine, .43%
Analysis: 40% RXN nitrogen
SGN: 215 maximum

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

45 1,200 50 Pound 0-0-7 fertilizer w/.67% acelepryn No Bid
Bags Active ingredient: Chlorantraniliprole, .67%

Analysis: Sulfate of Potash
SGN: 215

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50lb bag. Preferred size is 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product
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46 10 50 lb. bag Lebanon ProScapes 25-0-5 w/ .067% Acelepryn No Bid
and .167% Dimension
Product #: 2254792
NO SUBSTITUTES
SGN: 145

Item Notes: Unit price is per 50 lb. bag. Preferred package size: 50 lb. bag

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the package sizes and brand of product

47 60 Gallons Tracker Spray Pattern Indicator $18.86

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Big Foot Blue Dye
Marker - Manufactured by - Brandt -
Package size available is 2.5 gallon
containers - EPA Reg # - Not
Regulated

48 60 Gallons Cascade High Performance Water Infiltration No Bid
Active ingredients: Alkyl phenol ethoxylate, 10%
Polyethylene glycols, 90%
NO SUBSTITUTES

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product

49 40 1 lb. Quniclorac 75 DF Active ingredient: Quiclorac: 3, 7 - dichloro-8-quinolinecarboxylic acid No Bid
container 75%, other indredients: 25%

Item Notes: Unit price is per pound container. Preferred size is 1 pound container

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product
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50 30 Gallons Surge: sulfentrazone-67% 2,4-D dimethylamine salt 18.79% Mecoprop-p, dimethylamine $51.74
salt 6.80%
Dicamba dimethylamine salt -3.02%.

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of the product Product Bid is: Surge Herbicide -
Manufactured by - PBI Gordon
Company - Package size available
is 2.5 gallon containers - EPA Reg #
2217-867

51 10 Gallons Surflan: Active ingredient: Oryzalin: 3,5-dinitro-N4N4-dipropylsulfanilamide 40.4% Other $45.88
ingredients 59.6%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 1 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of the product Product bid is: Surflan AS Herbicide
- Manufactured by - UPI - Package
available is 2.5 gallon containers -
EPA Reg # 70506-44

52 5 Gallon Arsenal Herbicide $44.40
Active Ingredient: 27.8% Imazapyr

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred package size: 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product Product bid is: Arsenal Herbicide -
Manufactured by - BASF - Package
size available is 2.5 gallon
containers - EPA Reg# 241-346
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53 20 2.5 Gallons Perspective Herbicide ACTIVE INGREDIENT: By Weight: $92.32
Potassium salt of aminocyclopyrachlor
Potassium salt of 6-amino-5-chloro-2
-cyclopropyl-4-pyrimidinecarboxylic acid* .........25%
OTHER INGREDIENTS: ....................................75%
TOTAL: 100%
*Acid Equivalent:6-Amino-5-chloro-2-
cyclopropyl-4-pyrimidinecarboxylic acid
- 2 pounds acid per gallon or 21.2%

Manufacturer: Bayer or Equivalent

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon Preferred package size: 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes: Perspective Herbicide is a dry product and is priced by the pound, Perspective Herbicide is packaged in 1.25 lb.
containers (24 ounces) and in 5 pound containers (80 ounces), Limited supplies of Perspective in 2018 as the
manufacturer (Bayer) has quite making this product, might have to look at Method 240 SL Herbicide in the future

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Perspective Herbicide
- Manufactured by - Bayer -
Package sizes Available are 5 lb.
containers and 1.25 lb. containers -
EPA Reg # 432-1569

Alt 1 20 2.5 Gallons Alt Spec: Method 240 SL Herbicide 318.72

Alt Manufacturer: Bayer Alt Manufacturer #: None - EPA Reg # 432-1656

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon Preferred package size: 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Method 240 SL
Herbicide - Manufactured by - Bayer
- Avaliable in 2.5 gallon containers -
Priced PER GALLON at $318.72 -
EPA Reg # 432-1565

54 5 Gallons Methylated Seed Oil (MSO) Surfactant Herbicide, 100% $10.77

Manufacturer: Brewer International or Equivalent

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: MSO Surfactant -
Manufactured by - Loveland
Products - Package size available is
2.5 gallon containers - EPA Reg # -
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Not Regulated by EPA

55 100 Gallons Brewer 90/10 Non-Ionic Surfactant Active Ingredient:Alkyl aryl polyoxyethylene glycol and $8.50
other ethoxylated derivatives (surfactant) 70% Inert ingredients 30%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallons

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: 90/10 Brewer
Surfactant - Manufactured by
Brewer International - Package size
available is 2.5 gallon containers -
EPA Reg # - Not Regulated by EPA

56 15 Gallons Pathway Specialty Herbicide Active Ingredient: Picloram: 4-amino-3,5,6-trichloropicolinic $28.70
acid, triisopropanolamine salt - 5.4% 2,4-dichlorophenoxyacetic acid, triisopropanolamine
salt - 20.9% Inert Ingredients - 73.7%

Manufacturer: Dow AgroSciences or Equivalent

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallons

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List the package sizes and brand of product Product bid is: Pathway Herbicide -
Manufactured by - DOW
AgroSciences - Package size
available is 2.5 gallon containers -
EPA Reg # - 62719-31

57 40 Gallon Vivax surfactant No Bid
Active ingredients: polyethylene-polypropylene
glycols, 87.3%; dioctyl sulfosuccinate sodium, 3.75%
NO SUBSTITUTES

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred package size: 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Bag List the package size and brand of product
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58 50 Gallons Liquid Herbicide, POLARIS $44.40
Active Ingredient: Isoproplyamine Salt of Imazapyr:
(2-[4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-methylethyl)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol-2-yl]-3-pyridinecarbowylic acid)
- 27.7% Other Ingredients of 72.3%

Manufacturer: Nurarm or Equivalent

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes: Arsenal Herbicide has all same active ingredients, use rates, use sites and has aquatic labeling for needed
applications near and in waters, please see attached label for comparison.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Sizes and Brand List your package sizes and brand of the product Product bid is: Arsenal Herbicide -
Manufactured by - BASF - Available
package size is 2.5 gallon
containers - EPA Reg # 241-346

60 50 Gallon 4LB. AMINE $9.60
ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
Dimethylamine Salt of 2,4-Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid: 46.3%
INERT INGREDIENTS: 53.7%
TOTAL: 100.0%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon.
Preferred packages size: 2.5 gallon

Supplier Notes: Product bid is: Platoon, 2,4_D Amine Herbicide - Manufactured by UAPT - Available package size is 2.5 gallon
containers - EPA Reg # 228-145

Platoon 2, 4-D amine Herbicide has full aquatic labeling as well

61 160 Ounce Alligare MSM 60 or equivalent $2.10
ACTIVE INGREDIENT:
Metsulfuron Methyl
Methyl 2-(4-methoxy-6-methyl-1,3,5-triazin-2-yl)amino]-carbonyl]amino]sulfonyl]benzoate
60.0%
OTHER INGREDIENTS: 40%
TOTAL: 100.0%
EPA Reg. No. 81927-7 EPA Est. No. 81134-CHN-001

Item Notes: Unit price is per Ounce Preferred size is 16 ounce package.

Supplier Notes: Escort XP Herbicide is the Branded MSM product and is manufactured by Bayer now, not the generic that Alligare
MSM 60 is.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product Product bid is: Escort XP Herbicide -
Manufactured by Bayer - Available
package sizes are 16 ounce
containers and 64 ounce containers
- EPA Reg # 432-1549
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62 25 Gallon Aquatic Glyphosate 5.4 ACTIVE INGREDIENT: $15.25
Glyphosate*, N-(phosphonomethyl)glycine,
in the form of its isopropylamine salt 53.8%
OTHER INGREDIENTS: 46.2%
TOTAL: 100.0%

Item Notes: Unit price is per gallon. Preferred size is 2.5 gallon.

Supplier Notes: AquaNeat has full aquatic labeling as needed for shoreline vegetation and vegetation in standing or slow moving
waters as well, can be sprayed into the waters for vegetation control.

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Package Size and Brand List your package size and brand of product Product bid is: AquaNeat Herbicide -
Manufactured by - NuFarm -
Available package size is 2.5 gallon
containers - EPA Reg # 228-365

Response Total: $28,713.20




