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AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT
Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services

Bid No. 16-285
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 

City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission
Price Decrease

Schmieding Concrete, Inc.

This Amendment is hereby entered into by and between Schmieding Concrete, Inc., 4101 North
40th Street, Lincoln, NE 68504  (hereinafter “Contractor”) and City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and the
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission, (hereinafter “Owners”), for the purpose
of amending the Contract dated March 2, 2017, executed under City Resolution No. A-90268, and County
Contract C-17-0078, dated February 14, 2017, and executed by the City of Lincoln-Lancaster County
Public Building Commission, on February 14, 2017, for Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285, which is
made a part hereof by this reference.

WHEREAS, the parties hereby amend  the Contract to reflect a price decrease on the following:

Markup for Equipment and Material costs - 0%
Mobilization - Equipment and Labor - $0.00
8" thick concrete driveway - $6.50 SF
Type A and Type D Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - $3.00 LF

These changes are per Attachment A for the remainder of the current term; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION of the mutual covenants contained in the Contract,
under City Resolution No. A-90268, and County Contract C-17-0078 and stated herein the parties agree
as follows:

1) The parties hereby amend  the Contract to reflect a price decrease on the following: markup
for equipment and material costs, mobilization - equipment and labor, the cost of 8" concrete
driveway and Type A and Type D Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement.  These changes
are per Attachment A for the remainder of the current term.

2) All other terms of the Contract, not in conflict with this Amendment, shall remain in full force
and effect.

The Parties do hereby agree to all the terms and conditions of this Amendment.  This Amendment
shall be binding upon the parties, their heirs, administrators, executors, legal and personal
representatives, successors, and assigns.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties do hereby execute this Amendment upon completion of
signatures on:

Vendor Signature Page
City of Lincoln Signature Page
Lancaster County Signature Page
City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission Signature Page

ccvksl
Typewritten Text
C-17-0397
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Lancaster County Signature Page

_______________________________________________________________________________

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT
Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services

Bid No. 16-285
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 

City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission
Price Decrease

Schmieding Concrete, Inc.

EXECUTION BY LANCASTER COUNTY, NEBRASKA

Contract Approved as to Form:

                                                                      
Deputy Lancaster County Attorney

The Board of County Commissioners of
Lancaster, Nebraska

                                                                         

                                                                        

                                                                        

                                                                         

                                                                          

dated                                                                 

ccvksl
Typewritten Text
C-17-0397
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City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission
Signature Page

_______________________________________________________________________________

AMENDMENT TO CONTRACT
Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services

Bid No. 16-285
City of Lincoln, Lancaster County and 

City of Lincoln-Lancaster County Public Building Commission
Price Decrease

Schmieding Concrete, Inc.

EXECUTION BY LINCOLN-LANCASTER COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION

ATTEST:

______________________________________    _______________________________________
Public Building Commission Attorney Chairperson, Public Building Commission

dated __________________________________



Attachment 1

1 Revised 11/21/2016

Date:                                 

TO DEPARTMENT/AGENCY REPRESENTATIVE:                                                                          
FROM (CONTRACTOR):                 Schmieding Concrete                                                                                             AWARD LEVEL:  3
PROJECT DESCRIPTION:                                                                                                               

TIME OF COMPLETION

EQUIPMENT AND MATERIAL COSTS
ITEM COST Estimated Total

Total Rental Equipment Costs
Total Materials Cost
Total Shipping/Freight Cost

MOBILIZATION
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

 Mobilization - Equipment and Labor $0.00 HR

SCHEDULE I - CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quantity Estimated Total

1.  Type "B" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $4.00 LF
2.  Type "C" Sawing - Portland Cement Concrete Pavement $4.00 LF
3.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal $80.00 CY
4.  Concrete Sidewalk, 4" Thick $4.50 SF
5.  Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $5.00 SF
6.  Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $6.00 SF
7.  Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $6.50 SF
8.  Remove Concrete Sidwalk, 4" Thick $3.00 SF
9.  Remove Concrete Bikeway, 5" Thick $3.50 SF
10.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 6" Thick $4.00 SF
11.  Remove Concrete Driveway, 8" Thick $5.00 SF
Total

SCHEDULE II -  ASPHALTIC CONCRETE WORK
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UOM Quanitity Estimated Total

1.  Type "A" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement $3.00 LF
2.  Type "D" Sawing - Asphaltic Concrete Pavement $3.00 LF
3.  Miscellaneous Asphalt and Concrete Removal $80.00 CY
4.  Install Asphaltic Concrete Curb No Bid LF
5.  Remove Asphaltic Concrete Curb No Bid LF
6.  Install Concrete Curb $20.00 LF
7.  Remove Concrete Curb $10.00 LF
8. Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Class 2, Non-Arterial 
Streets & Parking Area No Bid SY
9.  Asphaltic Concrete Resurfacing No Bid TON
10.  Remove Concrete Curb $10.00 LF

% of Markup
0
0

This Document Is Required For All Unit Price Projects

Number of Days to Complete

CITY OF LINCOLN, LANCASTER COUNTY, CITY OF LINCOLN-LANCASTER                                   
COUNTY PUBLIC BUILDING COMMISSION                                                                    

UNIT PRICE QUOTATION

Unit Price - Pavement/Concrete Services, Bid No. 16-285

Fill in the following Tables in the areas as shown.      If an item does not apply, please do not make an entry in that column. 

                                                                                                                                                                 

Estimated Start Date



Attachment 1

2 Revised 11/21/2016

11.  Paint Pavement Marking with Glass Beads No Bid LF
12.  Paint Pavement Marking, without Glass Beads No Bid LF
13. Street Patching, 6" Thick No Bid SF
14. Street Patching, 8" Thick No Bid SF
15.  Alternate Sidewalk Repairs $16.00 Inch-Foot
Total

SUBCONTRACTORS COSTS
SUB-CONTRACTOR (NAME) COST % of Markup Estimated Total

Sub No. 1 5%
Sub No. 2 5%

FIRM:                                                                                   APPROVED BY:___________________

BY:                                                                                       Department Agency/Rep

ADDRESS:                                                                          PHONE NO:______________________

                                                                                             DATE:___________________________

$TOTAL ESTIMATED COST -- NOT TO EXCEED:

Change Order #: __________________ 
Accepted:_______________________ 
Not Accepted :___________________ 
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